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In the matter of
Oakland Tribune

The Oakland Tribune

I am a citizen of the United States; I am over the age of eighteen 
years, and not a party to or interested In the above-entitled matter,
I am the Legal Advertising Clerk of the printer and publisher of The 
Oakland Tribune, a newspaper published in the English language 
in the City of Oakland, County of Alameda, State of California

I declare that The Oakland Tribune is a newspaper of general 
circulation as defined by the laws of the State of California as 
determined by this court's order, dated December 6,1951, in the 
action entitled In the Matter of the Ascertainment and 
Establishment of the Standing of The Oakland Tribune as a 
Newspaper of General Circulation, Case Number 237798. Said 
order states that 'The Oakland Tribune is a newspaper of general 
circulation within the City of Oakland, and the County of Alameda, 
and the State of California, within the meaning and intent of 
Chapter 1, Division 7, Title 1 [§§ 6000 et seq.j, of the Government 
Code of the State of California." Said order has not been revoked, 
vacated, or set aside.

i declare that the notice, of which the annexed is a printed copy, 
has been published in each regular and entire issue of said 
newspaper and riot in any supplement thereof on the following 
dates, to wit:

12/17/2021

I certify (or declare) under the penalty of perjury that the foregoing 
is true and correct.

Executed at Rio Vista, California,
On this 17th day of December, 2021.

Public Notice Advertising Clerk
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