
C I T Y O F O A K L A N D
OrHd-l ' • < " H r . ' " . i • " ' F C L a R f -

AGENDA REPORT
2GP5J1 1 : : - ! PH 6= Ib

To: Office of the City Administrator
Attn: Deborah Edgerly, City Administrator
From: Budget Office
Date: June 8, 2006

Subject: Ordinance Amending Ordinance Number 12676 C.M.S. (Master Fee Schedule),
as Amended, to Establish, Modify, and Delete Fees Assessed by Selected Offices,
Departments, and Agencies of the City of Oakland

Summary

The attached ordinance amends Ordinance Number 12676 C.M.S. (the FY 2005-06 Master Fee
Schedule, or "MFS"), to establish, modify and delete fees and penalties assessed by the
following agencies or departments: Office of the City Council, Office of the City Administrator,
Office of the City Attorney, Office of the City Clerk, Community and Economic Development
Agency, Finance and Management Agency, Fire Services Agency, Office of Parks and
Recreation, Police Services Agency, and Public Works Agency. In most cases, changes to fees
are required to offset increases in costs related to the provision of services for which fees are
charged. In areas where fee comparisons are applicable, the City of Oakland's fees are similar to
other neighboring jurisdictions. Detailed explanations/justifications for fee changes are provided
in the "Discussion" section below.

A public hearing has been scheduled to review the proposed fee changes. The meeting will take
place at the time of the first reading of the proposed ordinance by the City Council, on June 8,
2006, at 5:00 pm or as soon as practically possible thereafter.

Fiscal Impact

The revenue from the proposed changes in fees will produce an estimated $0.53 million over the
amount projected in the FY 2005-07 Adopted Policy Budget. Of this amount, $0.27 million will
accrue to Fund 1010 (General Purpose Fund) and $0.26 million will accrue to Fund 2417 (Excess
Litter Fee Fund). The anticipated additional revenue will help offset increases in costs to provide
services for which the increased fees are charged, with no net gain. Both revenue and cost
increases have already been anticipated in the proposed FY 2006-07 Midcycle budget
adjustment.

Discussion

The following attachments are presented with this agenda report.

• Attachment A shows proposed changes to the Master Fee Schedule for FY2006-07, for
City Council adoption.

* Attachment B reflects changes already adopted by the City Council, but not yet reflected
in the published Master Fee Schedule document, because they were approved after the

Item No.
City Council Special Session

June 8, 2006



Deborah Edgerly
RE: Master Fee Schedule Changes - FY 2006-07 Page 2

previous annual document (FY 2005-06) had been published. Examples of such changes
include corrections to CEDA's Residential Rent Adjustment fee and Workforce
Development fee.

The Master Fee Schedule changes not yet approved by the City Council, and presented in
Attachment A, are summarized below, along with justifications and estimated revenue changes.

1. City Council

• The City Council has proposed to delete its fees for Council district handbook as
these handbooks are no longer available.

2. Office of the City Administrator - Marketing

• KTOP is proposing to increase its production services fees to offset rising costs of
providing services.

• In addition, KTOP is proposing to reduce certain fees based upon a recent analysis
and eliminate those fees which are no longer applicable.

• No changes in overall revenues are anticipated from the above fee modifications
because in addition to increasing some fees, KTOP has also deleted and reduced some
fees. Overall, the fee increases in some areas will be offset by the deletion and
reduction of fees in other areas.

3. City Attorney

• The Office of the City Attorney has proposed to increase its fees to reflect increased
costs to provide services (due to MOU agreements and changes in the fringe benefit
rate). In addition, rates were not updated in the FY05-06 Master Fee Schedule.

• The revenue increase of approximately $10,000 was anticipated and included in the
FY 2005-07 Adopted Policy budget.

4. City Clerk

• The City Clerk has proposed to increase its fee for subscribing to the Large Agenda
Packet to help offset the actual costs of providing service.

• The estimated annual revenue of $27,097 will accrue to Fund 1010 (General Purpose
Fund), and has been included in the Proposed FY 2006-07 Midcycle Amended
budget.

5. Finance and Management Agency

• The Finance and Management Agency (FMA) has proposed to increase its fee for on-
street parking meter in all areas except the central business district to $ 1.25 per hour.
The revenue increase of approximately $600,000 was anticipated and included in the
FY 2005-07 Adopted Policy budget.

Item No.
City Council Special Session

June 8,2006



Deborah Edgerly
RE: Master Fee Schedule Changes - FY 2006-07 Page 3

• In addition, FMA proposed to add a new fee for excess litter per adoption of Council
Ordinance number 12727 C.M.S., February 21, 2006. The estimated annual revenue
of $266,000 will accrue to Fund 2417 (Excess Litter Fee Fund), and has been
included in the FY 2006-07 Proposed Midcycle Amended budget.

6. Police Services

• The Police Services Agency (PSA) has proposed to increase the following fees: i) dog
license fees; ii) penalty fee for failure to renew a dog license within 30 days; iii)
redemption fee for claiming an impounded animal; iv) service fee for confining,
isolating and observing animal showing symptoms of rabies; v) maximum purchase
fee for any animal; vi) service fee for disposal of dead animals; vii) vehicle release
fees; viii) fee for signs containing visual and verbal warning; ix) fee to neuter/spay
dogs or cats; x) a penalty fee for a 2n inspection to enforce the Dangerous Dog
ordinance; and xi) fees for the animal shelter's medical procedures. The fee increases
will help to offset rising costs of providing services.

• The PSA has proposed to add the following new fees: i) fee to neuter/spay a male
cat/dog for a licensed not for profit rescue group; ii) fee for animal shelter medical
procedures; iii) a multiple dog fee per the passage of OMC Section 6.-04.400; and iv)
pet supplies. The new fees are proposed to help offset the actual costs of providing
services.

• The estimated additional revenue of $16,325 will accrue to Fund 1010 (General
Purpose Fund) and has been included in the Proposed FY 2006-07 Midcycle
Amended budget.

• The PSA also proposed to delete various fees and revise descriptions to better reflect
the actual services performed. No revenue loss is anticipated from the deletions, as
they are no longer applicable.

7. Fire Services

• The Fire Services Agency (FSA) has proposed to increase its fees by an average of
five percent across the board, to reflect increased costs to provide services (driven by
CPI and MOU increases).

• The FSA has also proposed to add new fees under High-Rise Inspections. The new
fees are proposed in order to reflect the actual services performed and help offset the
actual costs of providing such services.

• The revenue increase of approximately $84,000 was anticipated and included in the
FY 2005-07 Adopted Policy budget.

8. Office of Parks and Recreation

• The Office of Parks and Recreation (OPR) has proposed to increase family camp fees,
fees for cultural arts classes in Studio One and golfing fees. The fee increases will
help to offset rising costs of providing services and bring them in line with other
jurisdictions.

Item No.
City Council Special Session

June 8, 2006



Deborah Edgerly
RE: Master Fee Schedule Changes - FY2006-07 Page 4

• OPR has proposed to add the following new fees: i) Laser Sailing Club Pass Card; ii)
Tallship Adventure Sail; iii) After School Sailing; iv) Tallship/Sailing Camp; and v)
Advanced Keelboat Camp @ Estuary. The new fees are proposed to help offset the
actual costs of providing services.

• OPR has also proposed to delete the weekly rate fee for chartered bus travel and meal
charges for staff spouse/dependent and wrangler, as they are no longer applicable.

• In addition, OPR has also reduced some of its golfing fees to bring them in line with
other jurisdictions.

• No significant changes in overall OPR revenues are anticipated from the above fee
modifications because in addition to increasing some fees, OPR has also deleted and
reduced some fees. Overall, the fee increases in some areas will be offset by the
deletion and reduction of fees in other areas.

9. Public Works

• The Public Works Agency (PWA) has proposed to increase its Mailing Surcharge fee
to offset actual cost of sending documents using US Priority Mail "Flat Rate."

• PWA has also proposed several new fees: i) fee for undergrounding engineering
services; ii) cross street banner installation/removal fee; iii) fee to repair damage to
City of Oakland streetlight and traffic signal equipment; iv) fee for an electrical
engineering review; and v) credit card processing fee. The new fees will offset the
actual costs of providing services.

• In addition, PWA has revised some of its fee descriptions to better reflect the actual
services performed.

• Lastly, at the direction of the Public Works Committee in March 2006, Public Works
and Finance and Management Agency staffs have analyzed the annual costs of the
Residential Permit Parking program and determined that the permit fee would need to
be set at $65 per year in order to be fully cost-covering. The fully cost-covering rate
represents a 100 to 333% increase since the fees have not been adjusted since
inception of the program in 1986. The City may opt to implement the fee increase
over several years. The estimated additional revenue of $145,114 will accrue to Fund
1010 (General Purpose Fund).

10. Community and Economic Development Agency

• The Community and Economic Development Agency (CEDA) has proposed to
increase most of its fees by an average of four percent to reflect increased costs to
provide services.

• CEDA has proposed to add the following new fees: i) fees to process billing appeals
with referral to collections; ii) fees to process billing appeals for a second
research/review; iii) a fee for electronic payment transactions; iv) fee for a permit
record report; v) jobs/housing administrative appeal fee; and vi) fee to request a
redevelopment plan. The new fees are proposed to cover the actual costs of providing
development services.

Item No.
City Council Special Session

June 8, 2006



Deborah Edgerly
RE: Master Fee Schedule Changes - FY 2006-07 Page 5

• CEDA has proposed to delete the following fees: i) publications for uniform building,
plumbing, mechanical, swimming pool/spa/hot tub, fire code and national electrical
code; ii) various residential loan processing/origination/application fees; and iii) fee
for a report of residential building record ("3-R" report). The fees are being deleted
as they are no longer applicable.

• The estimated additional revenue of $78,888 will accrue to fund 1010 (General
Purpose Fund) and has been included in the FY 2006-07 Proposed Midcycle
Amended budget.

Recommendation

Staff recommends that the City Council accept this report and adopt the proposed ordinance
amending the Master Fee Schedule, as reflected in Attachment A. Once adopted, the amended
fees will become effective on July 1, 2006. A public hearing has been scheduled to review the
proposed fee changes. The meeting will take place at the time of the first reading of the proposed
ordinance by the Council, on June 8, 2006, at 5:00 pm or as soon as practically possible
thereafter.

Respectfully Submitted,

WILLIAM
Interim Budget Director

Prepared by:
Rowena Quindiagan, Assistant Budget Analyst
Budget Office

APPROVED FOR FORWARDING
TO CITY COUNCIL:

Office of the City Administrator

Attachments:

Attachment A - Proposed changes to the Master Fee Schedule for FY2006-07
Attachment B - Changes already adopted by the City Council, but not yet reflected in the
published FY 2005-06 Master Fee Schedule document

Item No.
City Council Special Session

June 8,2006



C Itv of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

l,200«

FEK DESCRIPTION

KTOP
A. PRODUCTION SERVICES

1 Videocassette Duplication
a. VMS T12Q (60 minutes 120 minutes)

b. VHST120
1 Super VMS Legislative Program (120 minutes)

10__. _DVD Legislative

Raw Stock (tape)
1 VMS (,

d.

WHS (60 minutoc)

Audio Tapes (blank)
1 Normal Bias (120 minutes)

2 High Bias (120 minutos)

On-Line Studio Production and Editing Equipment Rental
i. Teleprompter Day Rate

I. 600 Amp Electrical

m. Grip Package

u. "Smoke" Edit System (Hourly)

v. "Smoke" Edit System (Daily)

zar—Macintosh Graphic Station

ATTACHMENT A

CITY ADMINISTRATOR

OLD FEE /UNIT NEW FEE/UNIT % CHANGE

5,00 Tape

5,00 Tape

New

5.00 Tape

4££Q-

5.00 Tape

20.00 Hour

150,00 Day

200,00 Day

New

New

60.60—Heuf

5.00

2.00

Tape

DVD

5.00 Tape

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

180.00 Day

100.00 Day

100.00 Day

400.00 Hour

Negotiable Day

Deleted

desc only

desc only

desc only

800.00%

-33.33%

-50.00%

Item

C'ttv C'miiK'U Spix-ial Sessi



City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Effective: .l

FEE DESCRIPTION

A. PRODUCTION SERVICES
3 Individual Lights

g. Miscellaneous Lighting
2 Lowell Vfetee Lighting Kits

h. Ka.rnjQ.Kjt

i. Parabeam Kit

7 Butterflys and Overheads and Backdrops
k. Chroma Green Screen 20x20

I. Chroma Green Screen 30x40

12 VHS Editing Off-Line Equipment Rentals (Excluding Labor)
a. Media 100 Digital Editing System

b, Media 100 Digital Editing System

& Macintosh Graphic Workstation

13 Video Operator Technician Labor Charge
a. Labor Charges - Daytime

1 Operators ~ Regular

2 Operators ~ Overtime - First 2 Hours

3 Operators-Additional Hours

ATTACHMENT A

CITYADMIIVISTRATOR

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

50.00 Day

New

New

New

New

6&QO — Hew

SOrOO — Day

50.00

175.00

Day

Day

desc only

95.00 Day

120.00 Day

370.00 Day

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

25.00 Hour

40.00 Hour

44.00 Hour

40.00 Hour

60.00 Hour

Negotiated Hour

60.00%

50.00%

C'ity Council
Item _

Session



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Muster Fee Seliedule

CITYATTOBNEY

FKE DESCRIPTION
A. CITY ATTORNEY'S HOURLY RATES

1 Deputy City Attorney /

2 D&puty City Attorney II

3 Deputy City Attorney HI

4 Deputy City Attorney IV

5 Deputy City Attorney V

6 Paralegal

OLD FEE/UNIT NEW PEE/UNIT % CHANGE

113.00 Hour

137.00 Hour

153.00 Hour

163.00 Hour

209-00 Hour

9100 Hour

135.00 Hour

167.00 Hour

200.00 Hour

221.00 Hour

243.00 Hour

106.00 Hour

19.47%

21.90%

30.72%

20.77%

16.27%

16.4-8%

I te
Oify Cuiiiicil S|icriul .



ATTACHMENT A

titv of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

CITY CLERK.

FEE DESCRIPTION
A. OAKLAND CITY COUNCIL AGENDA PACKET

2 Subscriber
b. Large- Subscription with Attachments and Directory of Boards and Commissions; Picked Up

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

600.00 Year 1,000.00 Year 66.67%

iiie I Item
C'it.v Council SjK-i-ial Sessi

.InitvS. 2OOti



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Effective: Jnlv 1,2000

CITY COUNCIL

FEE DESCRIPTION

CITY COUNCIL ADMINISTRATION
A. COUNCIL DISTRICT HANDBOOK

4—Handbook (Including Tax)

3—Handbook Handling and Postage

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

&OQ Each

4^0—iaeh

Deleted

Deleted

Citv Council Special Session
JuiK'S. 200<l



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

I,2OO«

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

BUILDING SERVICES
ADMINISTRATION

A.-UNIFORM BUILDING CODE
4 — 1001LOOEQ Loaf Vol. 1

2 — 1901 Looso Loaf Vol. 2

3 — 1097 Loose Leaf Vol. 3

4 - 1004 Soft Cover Vol. 1

5 — 1 901 Soft Covor Vol. 2

€ — 1901 Soft Covor Vol. 3

? — 1 094 Analysis-of Revisions

3 — 1007LooGO Loaf Vol. 1

9 — 1007 Looso Loaf Vol. 2

44-1007 Looso Loaf Vol. 3

B.-NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE (NEC)
4 — 1093 Loose Leaf

2 — 1993 Soft COVOF

3 — 1003 Handbook to NEC

4 — 1006 LOOGO Loaf

PLUMBING CODE

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

4 — 700-f Loose-Leaf with Amondments

2 — 1QQ4 LOOGO Loaf

5 — 1994 Soft COVOF

4 — 1907 Loose Loaf

74^0—Cede

94,00—Cede

444,00—Gede

§9vOO—Cede

82rOO—Code

74rQ0—Code

4&QO—Gede

103.00—Cede

103.00—Cede

111.00—Cede

4?r£0—G0de

3S40—Cede

8240—G0de

SOrQO—Code

4&00—Gede

SSrOO—Gede

32^00—Cede

9&QO—Gede

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

j£ik 0 it*'"" __
t.itv Council Snccial Session

.him- 8.2OOO



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

COMMUNITY
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

-̂UNIFORM MECHANICAL CODE
4 — J004 Looeo Leaf

2 — 1094 Soft Cover

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

3 — 1907 LOOGO Loaf

R-UNIFORM SWIMMING POOL/SPA/HOT TUB CODE
QT-UNIFORM FIRE CODE
B. CODE AMENDMENTS
C. DUPLICATION OF DOCUMENTS

1 Microfilm Records

D. PERMIT APPLICATION FEE
Building, Electrical, Mechanical, Plumbing Permits
a. Project Value $2000 or Less

b. Project Value $2001 or Greater

c. Application and Issuance by Internet Connection

2 All Other Permits and All Other Engineering Process and Approval Requests
(Application)

3 Mailing and Handling Charges Per 25 Count for Permit Application Forms

4 Service Charge for Verification of Proof of License and Workers Compensation
Information Required by State Law for Approval of Permit Application

5 Zoning Sign-Off

E. DUPLICATION OF ANY DOCUMENT NOT SPECIFICALLY DESCRIBED IN
THE MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
2 Documents Not Routinely Produced in Multiple Copies for Distribution

F. PLANS/MAP PHOTO COPY (COPIES LESS THAN 11"x17")

6.40 Print

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

Deleted

6.50 Print

0.45 Document

44.00 Sign-Off

0.08 Page

0.60 Map

0.50 Document

46.00 Sign-Off

.10 Page

.65 Map

1 .56%

11.11%

45.00

59.00

44.00

59.00

6.40

12.60

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Mailing

Verification

47.00

61.00

46.00

61.00

6.75

13.00

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Mailing

Verification

4.44%

3.39%

4.55%

3.39%

5.47%

3.17%

4.55%

25.00%

8.33%

jse
City t oiiucil SjKi'itil Session

June S. 2OO(I



ATTACHMENT A

Cit.v of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

COMMUNITY AM>
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

G. DOCUMENT RESEARCH FEE

H. PROCESS BILLING APPEALS AND REFUND REQUESTS THAT ARE
DETERMINED TO BE UNFOUNDED

I. PROCESS BILLING APPEALS WITH REFERRAL TO "COLLECTIONS"

J. PROCESS BILLING APPEALS FOR SECOND RESEARCH/REVIEW

K.. PROCESSING SECURITY DEPOSITS, (BONDS, CASH, CERTIFICATE OF
DEPOSITS, ETC.) AND OTHER FORMS OF FINANCIAL SECURITY AS
REQUIRED FOR DEVELOPMENT PROJECTS AND CODE ENFORCEMENT

N. ELECTRONIC PAYMENT TRANSACTION FEE

O. JOBS/HOUSING IMPACT FEE {OVER 25,000 S.F. OFFICE/WAREHOUSE)
1_ Impact Fee

2 Administrative Appeal Fee

CODE COMPLIANCE
REDUPLICATE RELEASE OF LIEN/TERMINATION OF SUBSTANDARD

CODE ENFORCEMENT
A. VARIANCE FROM OAKLAND HOUSING CODE REQUIREMENTS

1 Administrative

2 Board

B. SERVICE FEES
1 Re-inspection to Verify or Monitor Progress of Violations Abatement

a. Conditions of Compliance

b. All Others

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

5.85 Quarter
Ho.uror
Fraction

83.00 Appeal

New

New

220.00 Each

New

4.00 Square
Foot

New

Document

320.00 Application

794.00 Application

83.00 Inspection

320.00 Inspection

Actual Cost Each
or 6.00

86.00 Appeal

86.00 Appeal

86.00 Appeal

229.00 Each

Actual Cost Each
or 2.00

4.00 Square
Foot

514.00 Appeal

Deleted

333.00 Application

826.00 Application

86.00 Inspection

333.00 Inspection

3.61%

4.09%

desc only

4.06%

4.03%

3.61%

4.06%

"» lie S I u-m_
fit* Ctmuril Special Session

S.-_'(HM>



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
FJlVftm':.liih I. 2OO6

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

B. SERVICE FEES
2 Process Code Enforcement Violation Appeals Determined to be Unfounded

3 Certificate of Occupancy
a. Basic Fee

b. Surcharge

c. Re-Inspection

5 Inspection Warrant

6 Complaint Investigation

C. ADMINISTRATIVE FEES
1 Contracted Work

a. Demolition

c. Bid/Contract Development

Public Documents (Order, Invoice, Demand Notice, Declaration, Lien Release,
Termination, Lien, etc.)
a. Preparation

b. Notarizing

Collections
Interest on Property UQR Fees and Penalties

c. Court Action

OLD FEE

New

553.00

83.00

83.00

553.00

83.00

1.587.00 or
31%

320.00

182.00

182.00

10.00%

Actual cost,
152.00

minimum

/UNIT

Premise

Add'l unit

Inspection

Instance

Inspection

Instance
or of
Contract,
Whichever

Instance

Document

Document

Per Year,
Based on
Unpaid
Balance
after Due
Date

Instance

NEW FEE

86.00

575.00

86.00

86.00

575.00

86.00

1,785.00 or
31%

333.00

189.00

189.00

10.00%

Actual cost,
189.00

minimum

/UNIT

Aooeal

Premise

Add'l unit

Inspection

Instance

Inspection

Instance
or of
Contract,
Whichever

Instance

Document

Document

Per Year,
Based on
Unpaid
Balance
after Due
Date

Instance

3.98%

3.61%

3.61%

3.98%

3.61%

12.48%

4.06%

3.85%

3.85%

24.34%

f)
( ilv ( niiiH'U Special Session

.Inm-S. 20Ott



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

I.2OOO

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

C. ADMINISTRATIVE FEES
4 Real Property Title Research

3. Litigation Guarantee

b. All Others

5 Compliance plan
a. Building not declared substandard

b. Building declared substandard

6 Process Violation

D. SUBPOENA
1 Witness Fee (Not Related to Employee's Duties)

E. APPEALS TO HEARING EXAMINER OR HOUSING ADVISORY AND APPEALS BOARD
1 Filing Fee

2 Conduct Appeals Hearing

3 Processing Fee

F. PUSHCART FOOD VENDING
1 Application Processing

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

2 Initial Permit Fee

164.00 or Report
Actual Cost

14.50 Instance

330.00 Plan

1,100.00 Plan

292.00 Instance

51.00+0.37 Request+
Mileage

59.00 Appeal

219.00 Houror
Fraction of

437.00 Appeal

63.00 Pushcart
(non-
refundable
applicatio
n fee to be
applied to
the permit
fee)

382.00 Pushcart
(includes
applicatio
n/processi
ng fee)

189.00 or Report
Actual Cost

15.00 Instance

343.00 Plan

1144.00 Plan

304.00 Instance

53.00+0.37 Request +
Mileage

61.00 Appeal

228.00 Hour or
Fraction of

454.00 Appeal

66.00 Pushcart
(non-
refundable
applicatio
n fee to be
applied to
the permit
fee)

397.00 Pushcart
(includes
applicatio
n/processi
ng fee)

15.24%

3.45%

3.94%

4.00%

4.11%

3.92%

3.39%

4.11%

3.89%

4.76%

3.93%

1'aito 10
C.'itv Council SjK'ciiil Session

S, d



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

:,hih I.2O4M*

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

F. PUSHCART FOOD VENDING
3 Permit Renewal Fee

5 Legalizing Illegal Vendor

G. VEHICULAR FOOD VENDING PERMIT
1 Application Processing

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

Initial Permit Fee

3 Permit Renewal Fee

5 Legalizing Illegal Vendor

H. PROCESSING VIOLATION APPEALS THAT ARE DETERMINED TO BE UNFOUNDED

ENGINEERING
A. PATH VACATION

B. STREET VACATION
1 Summary Vacation

2 Full Process and Procedure Vacation

3 Surcharge

382.00 Pushcart/
Year

765.00 Pushcart

114.00 Site (non-
refundable
applicatio
n fee to be
applied to
the permit
fee)

1,526.00 Site for 12
months
(includes
applicatio
n/processi
ng fee)

397.00 Pushcart/
Year

796.00 Pushcart

119.00 Site (non-
refundable
applicatio
n fee to be
applied to
the permit
fee)

1,587.00 Site for 12
months
(includes
applicatio
n/processi
ng fee)

3.93%

4.05%

4.39%

4.00%

1 ,526.00

3,053.00

83.00

1,800.00

2,294.00

4,370.00

727.00

Site Per
Year

Site

Appeal

Proceeding

Street

Street

Additional
Block

1,587.00

3,175.00

86.00

1872.00

2386.00

4545.00

756.00

Site Per
Year

Site

Appeal

Proceeding

Street

Street

Additional
Block

4.00%

4.00%

3.61%

4.00%

4.01%

4.00%

3.99%

C.'itv Council S|Kt>iitl Session



ATTACHMENT A

of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

I.2OOf>

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

C. EASEMENT
1 Abandonment

2 New

3 Shared Access Engineering Review

D. CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE
1 For Work Through Five Hours

2 For Work After Five Hours

E. REVIEW AS REQUIRED BY OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE FOR ISSUANCE
OF A PERMIT FOR ENCROACHMENT ON THE PUBLIC RIGHT OF WAY
OR EXECUTION OF A WAIVER OF DAMAGES AND INDEMNITY

1 Waiver of Damages and Indemnity Application

2 Minor Encroachment Permit
a. New and legal non-conforming encroachment

b. Legalizing Illegal Encroachment

3 Major Encroachment Permit

4 Rescission to Encroachment

5 Amendment to Existing Encroachment Permit

F. TRACT MAP
1 Tentative

2 Final

3 Surcharge/Lot

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

4.03%

3.99%

3.89%

3.96%

3.64%

1,639.00

727.00

437.00

656.00

110.00

437.00

727.00

1 ,399.00

1 ,227.00

219.00

218.00

2,884.00

2,589.00

219.00

Easement

Each

Easement

Certificate
for WorX

After 5
Hours

Certificate
for Work

After 5
Hours

Waiver

Permit

Permit

Permit

Rescission

Amendment

Map

Tract

Lot

1705.00

756.00

454.00

682.00

114.00

454.00

756.00

1,454.00

1,276.00

228.00

228.00

3,000.00

2,693.00

228.00

Easement

Each

Easement

Certificate

Hour or
Fraction of

Waiver

Permit

Permit

Permit

Rescission

Amendment

Map

Tract

Lot

3.89%

3.99%

3.93%

3.99%

4.11%

4.59%

4.02%

4.02%

4.11%

Cit> Council SjK'cinl Session
.ViiiK'S,2O(Mi



City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule.
Effective: J

FEE DESCRIPTION
F. TRACT MAP

4 Certificate of Correction

5 Subdivision Agreement Extension

Q Amended Map

7 Revisions to Final Map
a. Regular Operating Hours

b. Overtime Hours

G. PRIVATE SEWER ASSESSMENT DISTRICT
1 Application Fee

a. Four Lots or Less

b. Each Additional Lot

2 Assessment for Collection

H. STREET DEDICATION FEE

I. STREET NAME CHANGE
1 Application Fee

2 Service Fee

J. REVIEW OF PRIVATE PLAN/PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT PERMIT
1 $1 to $10,000 Construction Value

2 $10,001 - $50,000 Construction Value

ATTACHMENT A

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

437.00

727.00

110.00

110.00

160.00

3,242.00

364.00

272.00

727.00

1 ,639.00

393.00

1,202.00

1,202.00

62.00

Certificate

Agreement

Hour or
Fraction of

Hour or
Fraction of

Hour or
Fraction of

Four Lots

Lot

District

Street

Street

Block

Plan/lmpr
ovement

1st $10,000

Each
Additional
$1,000 or
Fraction
Thereof

454.00

756.00

114.00

114.00

166.00

3,372.00

379.00

283.00

756.00

1,705.00

409.00

1,250.00

1,250.00

64.00

Certificate

Agreement

Hour or
Fraction of

Hour or
Fraction of

Hour or
Fraction of

Four Lots

Lot

District

Street

Street

Block

Plan/lmpr
ovement

1st$10,OOC

Each
Additional
$1,000 or
Fraction
Thereof

3.89%

3.99%

3.64%

3.64%

3.75%

4.01%

4.12%

4.04%

3.99%

4.03%

4.07%

3.99%

3.99%

3.23%

'**•«">,...
Cilv Council S|H-rinl Session

Jiim-S,



Citv of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Kffi*ti\c:.Iii1> 1,2000

FEE DESCRIPTION

J. REVIEW OF PRIVATE PLAN/PUBLIC IMPROVEMENT PERMIT
3 $50,001 - $100,000 Construction Value

4 $100,001 - $500,000 Construction Value

5 Over $500,000 Construction Value

8 Extension ofP-Job Permit for Work Incomplete After One Year

9 Review of Plan Revisions
a. Regular Operating Hours

b. Overtime

K. FRANCHISE APPLICATION OR RENEWAL-DEPOSIT

1 Personal Services Fee Schedule

L. SPUR TRACK

ATTACHMENT A

COMMl INITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

OLD FEE/UNIT NEW FEE/UNIT % CHANGE

3,682.00

44.00

41.00

5,882.00

37.00

22,144.00

727.00

110.00

160.00

1,458.00

917.00

917.00

1st $50, 000

Each
Additional
$1,000 or
Fraction
Thereof

Each
Additional
$1,000 or
Fraction
Thereof

1st
$100,000

Each
Additional
$1,000 or
Fraction
Thereof

1st
$500.000

Plan/lmpr
ovement

Hour or
Fraction of

Hour or
Fraction of

Franchise

Permit

Permit

3,829.00

46.00

42.50

6,129.00

38.00

23,129

756.00

114.00

166.00

1,516.00

954.00

954.00

1st $50,000

Each
Additional
$1 ,000 or
Fraction
Thereof

Each
Additional
$1,000 or
Fraction
Thereof

1st
$100,000

Each
Additional
$1,000 or
Fraction
Thereof

1st
$500,000

Plan/lmpr
ovement

Hour or
Fraction of

Hour or
Fraction of

Franchise

Permit

Permit

3.99%

4.55%

3.66%

4.20%

2.70%

4.45%

3.99%

3.64%

3.75%

3.98%

4.03%

4.03%

City Council S[Kt-ial Sessi



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Ma.st.cr Fee Schedule
Effccti\c:Jiih 1. 2OOO

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

M. GRADING PERMIT
1 Basic Fee

2 Surcharge
a. 51 -1,000 Cubic Yards (c.y.)

b. 1,001 -2,000 Cubic Yards

c. 2,001 -10.000 Cubic Yards

d. Over 10,000 Cubic Yards

4 Review of Materials Related to Request for Wet Weather Grading Permit

5 Review of Plan Revisions
a. Overtime

b. Regular Operating Hours

N. WORK WITHOUT A GRADING PERMIT
1 Work Commenced

2 Re-Inspection Fee

O. CONSULTATION REQUESTED FOR PRELIMINARY REVIEW OF
IMPROVEMENTS AND CONSTRUCTION PROJECTS (ONE-HOUR

P. MYLAR PLAN RETRIEVAL

Q. CITY OF OAKLAND MAPS AND PLANS
1 2,400 Scale

2 1,500 Scale

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

977.00 Up to 50
Cubic Yds

1,016.00 Up to 50
Cubic Yds

3.99%

2.25

1.50

0.80

0.45

727.00

160.00

110.00

7,282.00

292.00

110.00

3.80

6.35

6.35

Each C.Y.
Over 50

Each C.Y.
Over 1000

Each C.Y.
Over 2000

Each C.Y.
Over

Permit

Hour or
Fraction of

Hour or
Fraction of

Occurrence

Inspection

Hour or
Fraction of

Plan

Map

Map

2.35

1.55

0.85

0.50

756.00

166.00

114.00

7,573.00

304.00

114.00

4.00

6.60

6.60

Each C.Y.
Over 50

Each C.Y.
Over 1000

Each C.Y.
Over 2000

Each C.Y.
Over

Permit

Hour or
Fraction of

Hour or
Fraction of

Occurrence

Inspection

Hour or
Fraction of

Plan

Map

Map

4.44%

3.33%

6.25%

11.11%

3.99%

3.75%

3.64%

4.00%

4.11%

3.64%

5.26%

3.94%

3.94%

I '<•»»_._
C'itv ( omicil S|K'ci(tl Session

.him- S. 2OOti



ATTACHMENT A

C ity of Oakland
.Master Fee Schedule

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

Q. CITY OF OAKLAND MAPS AND PLANS
3 Plans (copies larger than 11 "x17")

4 Seismic Book

R. SURFACE MINING OPERATIONS (RECLAMATION PLAN)
1 Permit Deposit (Minimum)

S. S-11 ENGINEERING REVIEW

T. PARCEL MAP
Tentative

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

Final

Waiver

Revisions to Final Parcel Map
a. Regular Hours

b. Overtime

U. EIR ENGINEERING REVIEW-DEPOSIT
1 Deposit

2 Hourly Rate (One Hour Minimum)

V. INSPECTION OF PRIVATE CONSTRUCTION OF PUBLIC FACILITY
3 Inspection

W. CONSTRUCTION SITE MONITORING (NATIONAL POLLUTANT
DISCHARGE ELIMINATION SYSTEM, DUST, NOISE)
1 Wet Weather Grading

2 Base Fee

3 Additional Inspection

6.00

26.40

727.00

750.00

1,090.00

984.00

372.00

110.00

160.00

874.00

110.00

110.00

1,650.00

275.00

110.00

Sheet

Book

Permit

Report

Map

Map

Map

Hour or
Fraction of

Hour or
Fraction of

Review

Hour or
Fraction of

Hour

Deposit

Inspection

Inspection

6.25

27.00

756.00

780.00

1,134.00

1,023.00

387.00

114.00

166.00

909.00

114.00

114.00

1,716.00

286.00

114.00

Sheet

Book

Permit

Report

Map

Map

Map

Hour or
Fraction of

Hour or
Fraction of

Review

Hour or
Fraction of

Hour

Deposit

Inspection

Inspection

4.17%

2.27%

3.99%

4.00%

4.04%

3.96%

4.03%

3.64%

3.75%

4.00%

3.64%

3.64%

4.00%

4.00%

3.64%

l*aa;o Hi
Clt.v Council SjKt-ml Sessiun

June S, 2OOO



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Ktteethe:.liih 1.2OOW

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

W. CONSTRUCTION SITE MONITORING (NATIONAL POLLUTANT
DISCHARGE ELIMINATION SYSTEM, DUST, NOISE)
4 Creek and Illicit Discharge Enforcement Re-inspection for Violation of the

Creek Protection Storm Water Management and Discharge Control Ordinance

X. PERMIT APPLICATION REVIEW
1 Permit Application Review and Processing Outside Normal Working Hours

(One Hour Minimum)

Y. RELEASE OF CLAIM AND HOLD HARMLESS AGREEMENT

Z. CREEK PROTECTION PERMIT
2 Category II

3 Category III

4 Category IV (Up to 7 Hours)

5 Each Additional Hour of Review Over 7 Hours

6 Appeal of Determination to Building Official

7 Appeal to the Planning Commission

8 Inspection
a. Base Fee (2 Inspections)

b. Additional Inspection

AA. PLAN CHECK AND INSPECTION FOR SITE DEVELOPMENT NOT
RELATED TO ANY OTHER REQUIRED PERMIT
1 Application Fee

2 Plan Check and/or Inspection

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

300.00 Inspection

160.00

110.00

Hour or
Fraction of

219.00 Release

59.00 Application

Hour or
Fraction of

312.00 Inspection

166.00 Hour or
Fraction of

228.00 Release

61.00 Application

114.00 Hour or
Fraction of

4.00%

3.75%

4.11%

145.00

437.00

873.00

110.00

339.00

627.00

221.00

110.00

Permit

Permit

Permit

Hour or
Fraction of

Appeal

Appeal

Inspection

Each
Inspection
Over 2

151.00

454.00

908.00

114.00

353.00

652.00

230.00

114.00

Permit

Permit

Permit

Hour or
Fraction of

Appeal

Appeal

Inspection

Each
Inspection
Over 2

4.14%

3.89%

4.01%

3.64%

4.13%

3.99%

4.07%

3.64%

3.39%

3.64%

1'iUEC 1T ''*•'"_
C'itv Couuril SjK-i-ial Session

JIIIK- S. 20OO



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

l,20Oti

COMMl JNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

AB. OBSTRUCTION PERMITS

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

1 Short-term Permits (Maximum of 14 Days)
a. Metered Area

b. Unmetered Area

c. No Parking Anytime Sign

2 Long-term Permits (15-180 Day Maximum)
a. Metered Area

b. Unmetered Area

AC. REVIEW OF GEOTECHNICAL REPORT REQUIRED FOR PROJECTS
LOCATED IN SEISMIC HAZARD ZONE AS IDENTIFIED BY THE STATE

1 Permit Application
a. Basic Fee Up to Three hours

b. Additional Fee After Three Hours

2 Request for Waiver Application
a. Basic Fee Up to Three Hours

b. Additional Fee After Three Hours

3 Peer Review
a. Basic Fee Up to Three hours

b. Additional Fee After Three Hours

c. Third Party Peer Review

4 Revisions
a. Normal Working Hours

29.00 Meter/Day

14.50 25 Ft/Day

2.65 Sign

870.00

435.00

Meter /30
Days

25 Ft/30
Days

509.00 Permit

110.00 Hour or
Fraction of

583.00 Request

110.00 Hour or
Fraction of

1,020.00 Review

110.00 Hour or
Fraction of

376.00 Review

110.00 Hour or
Fraction of

30.00 Meter/Day

15.00 25Ft./Day

2.75 Sign

904.00

452.00

Meter /30
Days

25 Ft/30
Days

529.00 Permit

114.00 Hour or
Fraction of

606.00 Request

114.00 Hour or
Fraction of

1,061.00 Review

114.00 Hour or
Fraction of

391.00 Review

114.00 Hour or
Fraction of

3.45%

3.45%

3.77%

3.91%

3.91%

3.93%

3.64%

3.95%

3.64%

4.02%

3.64%

3.99%

3.64%

'tiiic IS Item _
C.'it> Coniu-H SjH'Hul Session

.him S.'J



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

AC. REVIEW OF GEOTECHNICAL REPORT REQUIRED FOR PROJECTS
LOCATED IN SEISMIC HAZARD ZONE AS IDENTIFIED BY THE STATE
4 Revisions

b. Outside Normal Wording Hours

AD. MISCELLANEOUS ENGINEERING REVIEW
1 Regular Operating Hours

2 Overtime

AE. PAY TELEPHONE PERMIT
1 Application Processing Fee

2 Annual Renewal Fee

3 Late Fee

4 Reclaiming Fee for Removed Pay Phone

INSPECTION
A. INSPECTION

1 As Required by the Oakland Building Code and for the Issuance of a Permit
FOR NEW CONSTRUCTION as Required by the Oakland Building Code; or
as Required by the Oakland Sign Code Section and for the Issuance of a Permit
FOR NEW CONSTRUCTION as Required by the Oakland Sign Code

a. $1 to $1,000 Construction Value

b. $1,001 to $1,500 Construction Value

c. $1,500 to $2,000 Construction Value

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

160.00 Hour or
Fraction of

110.00 Hour or
Fraction of

160.00 Hour or
Fraction of

350.00 Pay
Telephone

105.00 Pay
Telephone

212.00 Pay
Telephone

Actual Pay
Cost, Telephone

455.00

166.00 Hour or
Fraction of

114.00 Hour or
Fraction of

166.00 Hour or
Fraction of

364.00 Pay
Telephone

109.00 Pay
Telephone

220.00 Pay
Telephone

Actual Cost, Pay
473.00 Telephone

minimum

3.75%

3.64%

3.75%

4.00%

3.81%

3.77%

3.96%

42.00 Permit

48.00 Permit

68.00 Permit

44.00 Permit

50.00 Permit

71.00 Permit

4.76%

4.17%

4.41%

*«!SC 1!) I'*'"' _
C'itv Council S|Kt-ial Session

.him-**, 200«



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

: Ju!> 1,

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

A. INSPECTION
1 As Required by the Oakland Building Code and for the Issuance of a Permit

FOR NEW CONSTRUCTION as Required by the Oakland Building Code; or
as Required by the Oakland Sign Code Section and for the Issuance of a Permit
FOR NEW CONSTRUCTION as Required by the Oakland Sign Code

d. $2,001 to $25.000 Construction Value
1 Basic Fee

2 Surcharge

e. $25,001 to $50,000 Construction Value
1 Basic Fee

2 Surcharge

$50,001 to $100,000 Construction Value
1 Basic Fee

2 Surcharge

g. $100,001 and Higher Construction Value
1 Bas/c Fee

2 Surcharge

h. $250,001 and Higher
1 Basic Fee

2 Surcharge

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

83.00 Permit
First $2,001

7.35 Each
Add'l $500

421.00 Permit
First

7.00 Each
Add'l

596.00 Permit
First

6.60 Each
Add'l

926.00 Permit
First

5.20 Each
Add'l

1,706.00 Permit

4.80 Each
Add'l

86.00 Permit
First $2,001

7.65 Each
Add'l $500

438.00 Permit
First

7.30 Each
Add'!

620.00 Permit
First

6.85 Each
Add'l

963.00 Permit
First

5.40 Each
Add'l

1,774.00 Permit

5.00 Each
Add'l

3.61%

4.08%

4.04%

4.29%

4.03%

3.79%

4.00%

3.85%

3.99%

4.17%

C'ilv 1 outu'il Special Session
Jnm'S.2OOO



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Effective: .liilj I,2OO«

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

A. INSPECTION
2 As Required by the Oakland Building Code for the Issuance of a Permit FOR

REPAIRS/ADDITIONS/ALTERATION, or as Required by the Oakland Sign
Code the Issuance of a Permit FOR REPAIRS/ADDITIONS/ALTERATION as
required by Oakland Sign Code
a. $1 to $1,000 Construction Value

b. $1,001 to $1,500 Construction Value

c. $1,501 to $2,000 Construction Value

d. $2,001 to $25,000 Construction Value
1 Basic Fee

2 Surcharge

e. $25,001 to $50,000 Construction Value
1 Basic Fee

Surcharge

$50,001 to $200,000 Construction Value
1 Basic Fee

2 Surcharge

g. $200,001 and Higher Construction Value
1 Basic Fee

2 Surcharge

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

52.00

57.00

78.00

99.00

8.80

504.00

8.30

712.00

7.80

1,882.00

6.05

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit
First $2,001

Each
Add'l $500

Permit
First

Each
Add'l

Permit
First

Each
Add'l

Permit
First

Each
Add'l

54.00

59.00

81.00

103.00

9.15

524.00

8.65

740.00

8.10

1,957.00

6.30

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit
First $2,001

Each
Add'l $500

Permit
First

Each
Add'l

Permit
First

Each
Add'l

Permit
First

Each
Add'l

3.85%

3.51%

3.85%

4.04%

3.98%

3.97%

4.22%

3.93%

3.85%

3.99%

4.13%

It cm _
Cit.v toiiin'il Special Session

JuneS. 2000



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fe

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

B. INSPECTION AS REQUIRED BY THE OAKLAND BUILDING CODE AND
FOR THE ISSUANCE OF A DEMOLITION PERMIT AS REQUIRED BY THE
OAKLAND BUILDING CODE

1 Basic Fee

2 Surcharge

C. COMMENCE OR COMPLETE WORK FOR WHICH PERMITS ARE
REQUIRED BY THE OAKLAND BUILDING CODE, OAKLAND SIGN CODE,
OR WINDOW BAR ORDINANCE WITHOUT FIRST HAVING OBTAINED

Investigation of Work

D. EXTRA INSPECTIONS

1 Building Permit
a. $1.00 to $2,000 Permit Value

b. $2,001 to $25,000 Permit Value

c. $25,001 to $50,000 Permit Value

d. $50,001 to $100,000 Permit Value

e. $100,001 to $500,000 Permit Value

f. $500,001 or Greater Permit Value

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

145.00 Permit

0.14 Square Foot

83.00 Inspection

83.00 Permit
First $2,001

83.00 Each
Inspection
OverS

83.00 Each
Inspection
Over6

83.00 Each
Inspection
Over 8

83.00 Each
Inspection
Over 10

83.00 Each
Inspection
Over 12

83.00 Inspection

151.00 Permit

0.15 Square Foot

86.00 Inspection

86.00 Permit
First $2,001

86.00 Each
Inspection
OverS

86.00 Each
Inspection
Over 6

86.00 Each
Inspection
OverB

86.00 Each
Inspection
Over 10

86.00 Each
Inspection
Over 12

86.00 Inspection

4.14%

7.14%

3.61%

3.61%

3.61%

3.61%

3.61%

3.61%

3.61%

3.61%

City Council S|KX-iitl Session
.him S. 2(KM>



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Kffci'tivc:.liih 1,

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

D. EXTRA INSPECTIONS
2 Electrical or Plumbing or Mechanical Permit

a. $1.00 to $100 Inspection Fee

b. $101 to $250 Inspection Fee

c. $251 to $500 Inspection Fee

d. $501 to $1,000 Inspection Fee

e. $1,001 to $5,000 Inspection Fee

f. $5,001 or Greater Inspection Fee

E. INSPECTION OF FIXTURES AND WASTE DEVICES
1 Plumbing Fixtures or Waste Discharge Device

2 Drainage and/or Vent Piping, Alter, Repair, or Replace

3 Rainwater Leader: Interior Area Drain Interceptor, On-site Storm System

4 Rainwater Piping to Gutter

5 Interceptor (Grease Trap)

6 Interceptor

7 Sewer Ejector Sump

8 Swimming Pool (Complete)

OIJ> FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

83.00

83.00

83.00

83.00

83.00

83.00

15.00

15.00

23.00

37.00

73.00

73.00

73.00

145.00

Each
Inspection
OverS

Each
Inspection
Over 5

Each
Inspection
Over 6

Each
Inspection
Over8

Each
Inspection
Over 10

Permit
First $2,001

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

86.00

86.00

86.00

86.00

86.00

86.00

16.00

16.00

24.00

38.00

76.00

76.00

76.00

151.00

Each
Inspection
Over3

Each
Inspection
OverS

Each
Inspection
Over 6

Each
Inspection
Over8

Each
Inspection
Over 10

Permit
First $2,001

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

3.61%

3.61%

3.61%

3.61%

3.61%

3.61%

6.67%

' 6.67%

4.35%

2.70%

4.11%

4.11%

4.11%

4.14%

Item __
Citv Council Spit-iiil Session

JiiiK-S, 20OO



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Fee Schedule

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

E. INSPECTION OF FIXTURES AND WASTE DEVICES
9 Roman Tub and/or Baptistery

10 Dishwashing Equipment
a. Domestic

b. Commercial

11 Garbage Disposal Unit
a. Domestic

b. Commercial

12 Backwater Valve

13 Plumbing Inspection of New Apartments Larger Than Four Units (Additional
Fees are Required for all Water Services, Rainwater Systems, Gas Systems
and Units with More than Two Bathrooms)

14 Waste Alteration

F. INSPECTION OF WATER PIPING
1 Water Service (Building Supply) New or Replacement

2 Water Piping, Alter or Repair

3 Water Treatment Equipment

4 Water Heater (Gas or Electric) and/or Storage Tank

5 Backflow Device Including Bail-Cock

6 Pressure Reducing Valve

G. INSPECTION OF FIRE PROTECTION AND SPRINKLERS
1 Fire Protection System, Connection to Domestic Water

2 Lawn and Garden Sprinkler System, Each Controlled Zone

OLJ> FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

73.00 Each

23.00 Each

76.00 Each

24.00 Each

4.11%

15.00

23.00

15.00

23.00

23.00

10.00

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Hour or
Fraction of

16.00

24.00

16.00

24.00

24.00

114.00

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Hour or
Fraction of

6.67%

4.35%

6.67%

4.35%

4.35%

3.64%

4.35%

23.00

23.00

23.00

23.00

23.00

23.00

23.00

23.00

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

24.00

24.00

24.00

24.00

24.00

24.00

24.00

24.00

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

4.35%

4.35%

4.35%

4.35%

4.35%

4.35%

4.35%

4.35%

( ity ( oiiiH'il S|H'<-i;il S
S, 20OO



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FKK DESCRIPTION

H. INSPECTION OF GAS AND OIL PIPING
1 Low Pressure Meter Outlets

2 Medium or High Outlets

I. INSPECTION OF COOLING EQUIPMENT
1 Cooling System

a. To 100,000 BTU

b. Over 100,000 BTU

2 Evaporative Cooler

3 Condenser/Compressor-Evaporator Coil Replacement

4 Variable Air Volume Dampers

5 Low Pressure Duct System

J. INSPECTION OF HEAT EQUIPMENT
1 Furnace: Central, Floor, Wall, Unit, Duct or Decorative

2 Range, Oven, Dryer, Circulating Heater, Fryer, Steamer, Cooker, Barbecue or
Log Lighter
a. Domestic

b. Commercial

3 Gas Torch, Gas Light, Bunsen Burner or Miscellaneous Small Gas Burner

4 Radiator, Convector, or Panel

5 Incinerator or Kiln
a. Domestic

b. Commercial

6 Boiler
a. To 30 Horsepower

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

44.00

73.00

37.00

57.00

37.00

23.00

15.00

29.00

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

46.00

76.00

38.00

59.00

38.00

24.00

16.00

30.00

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

4.55%

4.11%

2.70%

3.51%

2.70%

4.35%

6.67%

3.45%

37.00 Each 38.00 Each 2.70%

15.00

23.00

15.00

23.00

37.00

73.00

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

16.00

24.00

16.00

24.00

38.00

76.00

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

6.67%

4.35%

6.67%

4.35%

2.70%

4.11%

73.00 Each 76.00 Each 4.11%

jiiit- 25
Oitv Council S|H-cinl Session



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Muster Fee Schedule
EttcothctJiih I. 2OOO

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

J. INSPECTION OF HEAT EQUIPMENT
6 Boiler

b. Over 30 Horsepower

7 Heat Pump

8 Dual Unit, Heating and Cooling

9 Miscellaneous Industrial

10 Conversion Burner, Manufactured Fireplace

11 Low Pressure Duct System

K. INSPECTION OF EXHAUST SYSTEMS
1 Range Hood (Commercial)

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

Environmental Air Ducts
a. Residential

b. Commercial

3 Gas Vent (Flues)

4 Industrial Processing Equipment Exhaust System

5 Fan or F/C Unit
a. To 10,000 CFM

b. Over 10,000 CFM

L. INSPECTION OF MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS
1 Fire Damper and/or Sub-Duct

2 Electrostatic Filter

3 Condensate Drain System

4 Humidifier

5 Manufactured Home-Plumbing System

117.00

37.00

66.00

117.00

73.00

29.00

145.00

15.00

37.00

15.00

117.00

29.00

57.00

15.00

15.00

15.00

15.00

110.00

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

122.00

38.00

69.00

122.00

76.00

30.00

151.00

16.00

38.00

16.00

122.00

30.00

59.00

16.00

16.00

16.00

16.00

114.00

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

4.27%

2.70%

4.55%

4.27%

4.11%

3.45%

4.14%

6.67%

2.70%

6.67%

4.27%

3.45%

3.51%

6.67%

6.67%

6.67%

6.67%

3.64%

Item _

Cit.v Council S|K^*i»l Session
, 2OOO



ATTACHMENT A

Citv of Oakland
Master Fee Seliednle
Efl<*'tnc:Jnh I.20OO

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

L. INSPECTION OF MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS
6 Manufactured Home-Mechanical System

7 For Each Additional Attached Unit

M. REQUEST INSPECTIONS OUTSIDE OF NORMAL WORKING HOURS (2.5
HOURS MINIMUM)

N. FIELD CHECK INSPECTION FEE

O. ZONING INSPECTIONS FOR BUILDING PERMITS
1 New Construction up to $200,000

2 New Construction over $200,000

3 Additions/Alterations over $5,000

Q. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION OF NEW APARTMENTS LARGER THAN
FOUR-UNITS. ADDITIONAL FEES ARE REQUIRED FOR ALL APPLIANCES,
MOTORS, SERVICES, FEEDERS AND BRANCH CIRCUITS

R. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION OF NEW RESIDENTIAL APPLIANCE
INCLUDING ROUGH OUTLET
1 Range, Range Top or Oven

2 Dryer

3 Fan Under 1 Horsepower

4 Disposal or Dishwasher

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

3.64%

2.70%

4.14%

3.61%

4.14%

4.14%

110.00

37,00

145.00

83.00

145.00

145.00+70.
00

145.00

110.00

15.00

15.00

1.50

6.00

Each

Each

Hour or
Fraction of

Permit
First $2,001

Permit

Permit +
Each
$100.000
Over
$200,000,
Not to
Exceed
$10,000

Permit

Hour or
Fraction of

Each

Each

Each

Each

114.00

38.00

151.00

86.00

151.00

151.00+73.0

151.00

114.00

16.00

16.00

1.55

6.25

Each

Each

Hour or
Fraction of

Permit
First $2,001

Permit

Permit +
Each
$100,000
Over
$200,000,
Not to
Exceed
$10,000

Permit

Hour or
Fraction of

Each

Each

Each

Each

4.14%

3.64%

6.67%

6.67%

3.33%

4.17%

C'il\ Council S|ie<'i;il Session



ATTACHMENT A

Citv of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Effective: Juh I.2OO4*

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

S. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION OR MISCELLANEOUS INSPECTION
1 Air Conditioning Unit

a. Basic Fee

b. Surcharge

2 Beverage or Freezer Case (Cabinet Only)

3 Dental Unit, Gasoline Dispenser or Sterilizer

4 Vegetable or Meat Case, X-ray Machine or Motion Picture Machine

5 Pool, Spa, Hot Tub, Hydro Massage, Bath Tub
a. Swimming Pool

b. Outdoor - Hot Tub. Spa

c. Indoor - Hot Tub, Spa, Hydro Massage Bath Tub

d. Fountains

6 Manufactured Home and Other State-Approved Buildings
a. Additional Sections

7 Low Voltage Systems

T. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION
1 Branch Circuit and Feeder for Lighting, Heating, Power Signaling, or Other

2 Outlet, Including Attached Receptacle, When Installed Not More Than 24
Inches Apart for Border, Strip, or Footlight, or for Outline Decorative Display,
or Group Lighting Elsewhere When in Show Window Lighting and on Electric

3 Outlet, Including Attached Receptacle, for Temporary Festoon or Decorative
Lighting or for Temporary Working Light for Use in Building Construction

4 Plastic Outlet Boxes in Fire Related Construction, Not Including Device

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

29.00

3.00

15.00

15.00

15.00

117.00

73.00

52.00

44.00

37.00

140.00

4.50

0.75

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Permit

Each

Each

30.00

3.15

16.00

16.00

16.00

122.00

76.00

54.00

46.00

38.00

146.00

4.70

0.80

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Permit

Each

Each

3.45%

5.00%

6.67%

6.67%

6.67%

4.27%

4.11%

3.85%

4.55%

2.70%

4.29%

4.44%

6.67%

0.75 Each

1.50 Each

0.80 Each

1.55 Each

6.67%

3.33%

»a«e 2S Item _
Citv Council S|K*ri«l Session

JUIK- S. JOOtt



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

, 2OOO

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

U. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION OF MOTORS, GENERATORS, MOTOR-
GENERATOR SETS, BALANCER SETS, DYNAMOTORS, CONVERTERS,
TRANSFORMERS, BALANCING COILS, OR RECTIFIERS INCLUDING ALL

1 Basic Fee

2 Maximum Fee

V. INSPECTION OF ELECTRICAL SERVICE
1 Service Over 600 Volts

a. First 200 KVA

b. Over 200 KVA

2 Service 600 Volts or Less
a. Basic Fee for First 100 Ampere Capacity Including 1 Meter

b. Surcharge (Each Additional 100 Ampere or Fraction Thereof)

c. Additional Meter

W. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION OF LIGHTING FIXTURE
1 Incandescent

2 Florescent Lighting Fixture (Complete with One Ballast)

3 Mercury Vapor, High Pressure Sodium and Similar Lighting Fixture

X. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION OF A SWITCH WHEN NOT ATTACHED TO OR
INCLUDED WITH APPARATUS NOT SPECIFICALLY CLASSIFIED IN THE
MASTER FEE SCHEDULE

Y. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION OF RECEPTACLE, WALL SOCKET, OR
SIMILAR FIXTURE NOT SPECIFICALLY CLASSIFIED IN THE MASTER FEE

Z. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION OF AIR, WATER OR OTHER TYPE HEATER,
WELDING MACHINES OR COMMERCIAL RANGES
1 Basic Fee

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANCE

3.00 Each HP,
KVA, or KW

220.00 Unit

145.00 Permit

220.00 Unit

58.00 Each

44.00 Each

9.00 Each

1.50 Each

3.00 Each

4.50 Each

1.50 Each

1.50 Each

3.00 Each HP,
KVA or

3.15 Each HP,
KVA, or KW

229.00 Unit

151.00 Permit

229.00 Unit

60.00 Each

46.00 Each

10.00 Each

1.55 Each

3.15 Each

4.70 Each

1.55 Each

1.55 Each

3.15 Each HP,
KVA or

5.00%

4.09%

4.14%

4.09%

3.45%

4.55%

11.11%

3.33%

5.00%

4.44%

3.33%

3.33%

5.00%

t 'it\ Council Special Session
.Inm-S. 20O<»



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

l,200ti

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

Z. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION OF AIR, WATER OR OTHER TYPE HEATER,
WELDING MACHINES OR COMMERCIAL RANGES
2 Maximum Fee

AA. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION OF A NEW ELECTRIC SIGN BEARING AN
APPROVED LABEL INCLUDING CONNECTION

AB. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION REQUIRED ON AN EXISTING SIGN DUE TO
MINOR ALTERATIONS ON AND/ORMOVING OF THE SIGN

AC. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION OF OUTLINE NEON OR COLD CATHODE

AD. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION IF MACHINE APPARATUS OR APPLIANCE NOT
SPECIFICALLY CLASSIFIED IN THE MASTER FEE SCHEDULE
1 Basic Fee

2 Maximum Fee

AE. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION OF A FORCED AIR FURNACE

AF. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION OF A MOVED BUILDING (ONE HOUR

AG. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION OF CONSTRUCTION OR TEMPORARY
SERVICE (POLE OR UNDERGROUND)

AH. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION (ONE HOUR MINIMUM)
Survey of Electrical Work or Equipment Pursuant to a Request

Al. ELECTRICAL INSPECTION AS REQUIRED BY OAKLAND MUNICIPAL
CODE (METER RESETS)
1 Single Family Dwelling

2 Apartment

3 Commercial or Industrial

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

220.00 Unit

37.00 Unit

29.00 Unit

10.00 EachKVA
Unit

3.00 Each KW
orKVA

220.00 Unit

15.00 Unit

52.00 Hour or
Fraction of

66.00 Unit

110.00 Hour or
Fraction of

229.00 Unit

38.00 Unit

30.00 Unit

11.00 Each KVA
Unit

3.15 Each KW
or KVA

229.00 Unit

16.00 Unit

54.00 Hour or
Fraction of

69.00 Unit

114.00 Hour or
Fraction of

4.09%

2.70%

3.45%

10.00%

5.00%

4.09%

6.67%

3.85%

4.55%

3.64%

29.00

23.00

58.00

Each

Each

Hour or
Fraction of

30.00

24.00

60.00

Each

Each

Hour or
Fraction of

3.45%

4.35%

3.45%

City (.'oiim-ii Special Session
.Inn.'V-MMMi



ATTACHMENT A

Citv of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

AJ. SPECIAL PERMIT AS ALLOWED BY OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE (PLANT

AK. UNREINFORCED MASONRY ORDINANCE - BUILDING PERMIT FEES
1 Engineering Analysis Report Review

2 Request to Postpone Retrofit Work (Abutting Building)

5 URM Building List
a. List

b. Computer Disk

6 Field Inspection/Site Visits (1 Hour Minimum)

AM. REPORT OF PERMIT RECORD
1 Research for Permit Record

2 Determination or Assessment

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

110.00 Hour or
Fraction of

728.00 Agreemen

728.00 Agreemen

37.00 Unit

73.00 Each

110.00 Hour or
Fraction of

New

New

114.00 Hour or
Fraction of

757.00 Agreemen

757.00 Agreemen

38.00

76.00

114.00

Unit

Each

Hour or
Fraction of

86.00 Hour or
Fraction of

86.00 Each

3.64%

3.98%

3.98%

2.70%

4.11%

3.64%

REPORT OF RESIDENTIAL BUILDING RECORD ("3 R" REPORT) AS
REQUIRED BY THE OAKLAND HOUSING CODE
1 Standard Research (Completion within 5 Working Days)

ar - First Hour or Fraction Thereof

& - After First Hour

Expoditod RoGoarch (Completion within 2A Hours)
ar - First Hour or Fraction Thereof

After First Hour

145.00—Remit Deleted

410.00—Hour or Deleted
Fraction of

184.00—Hour or Deleted
Fraction of

110.00—Hour or Deleted
Fraction of

!*<•«' i.—
City Council Special Session

.fniK-S.2000



ATTACHMENT A

City ofOakland
Master Fee Schedule

1.200<i

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

AN. CODE BULLETINS
1 Complete Set

2 Subscription for Quarterly Updates

3 Individual Bulletins

AO. FOUNDATION RETENTION PERMIT FEE
1 Application Fee

2 Inspection Fee

3 Annual Inspection

4 Partial Removal

AP. FOUNDATION REMOVAL PERMIT FEE

AQ. CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY RELATED TO CONSTRUCTION PERMITS
1 Certificate of Occupancy

2 Temporary Certificate of Occupancy

PLAN CHECK
A. PLAN CHECKING AND/OR PROCESSING OF APPLICATION FOR A

PERMIT REQUIRED BY OAKLAND BUILDING CODE OR OAKLAND SIGN
CODE OR ANY SECTION OF THE OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE

4 Request Plan Checking or Inspections Outside of Normal Working Hours (One
Hour Minimum)

5 Consultation Requested for Preliminary Plan Review by Plan Check Staff (One
Hour Minimum)

a. Regular Operating Hours

b. Overtime Hours

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

133.00

26.00

0.50

352.00

160.00

290.00

548.00

548.00

220.00

440.00

Set

Quarter

Sheet

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

138.00

27.00

0.55

366.00

166.00

302.00

570.00

570.00

229.00

458.00

Set

Quarter

Sheet

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

3.76%

3.85%

10.00%

3.98%

3.75%

4.14%

4.01%

4.01%

4.09%

4.09%

160.00 Hour or
Fraction of

110.00 Hour or
Fraction of

160.00 Hour or
Fraction of

166.00 Hour or
Fraction of

114.00 Hour or
Fraction of

166.00 Hour or
Fraction of

3.75%

3.64%

3.75%

C'itv Council S
'*<•"'__
Session

S, 200(t



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule"
KHccthc:Jnlj

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

A. PLAN CHECKING AND/OR PROCESSING OF APPLICATION FOR A
PERMIT REQUIRED BY OAKLAND BUILDING CODE OR OAKLAND SIGN
CODE OR ANY SECTION OF THE OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE
6 Additional Checking and/or Processing Required Due to Plan Deficiencies or

Changes (One Hour Minimum)

B. INSTALLATION / REGISTRATION / INSPECTION CERTIFICATION FOR RE-
ROOFING PERMIT

C. ASSIGNMENT AND DESIGNATION OF BUILDING NUMBERS AS
REQUIRED BY OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE
1 Dwelling

2 Other (Building, Apartment, or Hotel)

3 Change of Address

D. PROCESSING OF A BUILDING MOVING APPLICATION AS REQUIRED BY
OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE

E. SERVICE CHARGE TO PROCESS REQUEST TO EXTEND PERMIT
EXPIRATION LIMITATION OR REINSTATE PERMIT
1 Extension or Reinstatement

F. NOISE STUDY FOR BUILDING PERMIT

G. BOARD OF EXAMINERS & APPEALS
1 Grade I - Minimum Code Technically or Deviations Requiring Limited

Management Staff Time

2 Grade II - Code Violations Found During Plan Checking or Field Inspection
Requiring Field Review by Management

3 Grade HI - Appeals Regarding Code Requirements When Projects are Still in
the Design Stage

4 Grade IV - Dangerous Building Code and Appeals by Other City Departments

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

110.00 Hour or
Fraction of

16.50 Permit

114.00 Hour or
Fraction of

17.00 Permit

3.64%

3.03%

39.00

59.00

300.00

750.00

59.00

150.00

150.00

300.00

750.00

750.00

Building
Number

Building
Number

Request

Permit

Permit

Study

Appeal

Item

Appeal

Appeal

41.00

61.00

312.00

780.00

61.00

156.00

156.00

312.00

780.00

780.00

Building
Number

Building
Number

Request

Permit

Permit

Study

Appeal

Item

Appeal

Appeal

5.13%

3.39%

4.00%

4.00%

3.39%

4.00%

4.00%

4.00%

4.00%

4.00%

t'itv ( oiiiu'il Sntfiitl Sessi
June S.



ATTACHMENT A

Cit.vofOsikla.iul
Master Fee Schedule

COMMUNITY AIVD
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION
H. SITE PLAN REVIEW

1 Site Plan Review

2 Parking Review (Basic Fee)

3 Surcharge
a. 5-20 Parking Spaces

b. 21-40 Parking Spaces

c. 41-120 Parking Spaces

d. 121-300 Parking Spaces

e. 301 or More Parking Spaces

I. GEOLOGICAL REPORT REVIEW OR GEOLOGICAL REPORT WAIVER
REVIEW AS REQUIRED BY OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE
1 Geological Report Deposit

a. Report Review

Review of Waiver of Geological Report Requirements
Letter of Waiver by Director of Public Works

3 Comments and Advice Offered by City to State Mining and Geology Board and
State Geologists as Part of a Waiver Investigation Pursuant to Chapter 7.5,
Section 2623 of the Public Resources Code of the State of California

J. MAKING BUILDING RECORDS AVAILABLE FOR VIEWING AND/OR
COPYING FROM ARCHIVES

K. PROCESSING REQUEST FOR HANDICAPPED EXCEPTION TO TITLE 24
1 Grade I - Minimum Code Technically Requiring Limited Staff Time

2 Grade II - Code Violation Requiring Field Review or Additional Staff Time

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

750.00

150.00

225.00

328.00

438.00

547.00

657.00

Plan

Plan

Plan

Plan

Plan

Plan

Plan

780.00

156.00

234.00

341.00

456.00

569.00

683.00

Plan

Plan

Plan

Plan

Plan

Plan

Plan

4.00%

4.00%

4.00%

3.96%

4.11%

4.02%

3.96%

728.00 to Estimate
2,294.00 Cost of

Geologist'
s Fee

29,00 Instance

150.00 Each

300.00 Each

757.00 to Estimate
2,386.00 Cost of

Geologist'
s Fee

30.00 Instance

156.00 Each

312.00 Each

3.98%

241.00

307.00

714.00

Report

Letter of
Waiver

Waiver

251.00

319.00

743.00

Report

Letter of
Waiver

Waiver

4.15%

3.91%

4.06%

3.45%

4.00%

4.00%

Cit.v Council S|K>citil Session
. JOOft



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Effective: Jill.*

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

K. PROCESSING REQUEST FOR HANDICAPPED EXCEPTION TO TITLE 24
3 Grade /// - Appeals Regarding Code Requirements when Projects are in

L. DUPLICATE INSPECTION RECORD CARD
1 Replace

2 Research

M. PROCESSING REQUEST FOR ALTERNATE MATERIALS OR METHOD OF
CONSTRUCTION
/ Grade / - Minimum Code Deviations Requiring Limited Staff Time

2 Grade II - Code Violations Found During Plan Checking or Field Inspection
a. First Two Requests

b. Additional Request

3 Grade /// - Appeals Regarding Code Requirements When Projects are Still in
the Design Stage
a. First Two Requests

b. Additional Request

N. DRIVEWAY APPEALS
1 Grade I - Minimum Code Deviations Requiring Limited Staff Time

2 Grade II - Code Violations Found During Plan Checking or Field Inspection
Requiring Field Review by Management

3 Appeals for Projects in Design Stage

4 Appeals to City Council

O. PLAN CHECK FEE FOR DRIVEWAY PERMITS

P. PROCESSING FEE FOR DEMOLITION PERMITS
(EXEMPT: SFD DETACHED GARAGE LESS THAN 400 S.F.I

Q. PROCESSING FEE FOR TREE REMOVAL PERMITS
1 Developed Property

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

750.00 Appeal

6.75 Card

39.00 Instance

150.00 Request

300.00 Request

550.00 Request

750.00 Request

1,100.00 Request

153.00 Appeal

300.00 Appeal

450.00 Appeal

432.00 Appeal

74.00 Permit

338.00 Permit

45.00 Permit

780.00 Appeal

7.00 Card

41.00 Instance

156.00 Request

312.00 Request

572.00 Request

780.00 Request

1,144.00 Request

159.00 Appeal

312.00 Appeal

468.00 Appeal

449.00 Appeal

77.00 Permit

352.00 Permit

47.00 Permit

4.00%

3.70%

5.13%

4.00%

4.00%

4.00%

4.00%

4.00%

3.92%

4.00%

4.00%

3.94%

4.05%

4.14%

4.44%

**«•"> _,
(itv Council Special Session

JuiieS,-2



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

Q. PROCESSING FEE FOR TREE REMOVAL PERMITS
2 Undeveloped Property

R. PROCESSING FEE FOR UTILITY COMPANY EXCAVATION PERMIT

S. EARTHQUAKE DAMAGE ASSESSMENT REVIEW (No Report Fee for
Owner-Occupied Single Family Dwellings)
1 Minor Report (Less Than 3 Hour Review)

2 Major Report (3 Hour Review or Over)

T. PLAN CHECK FEE FOR PLANNING PERMITS
1 New Construction Up to $200,000

2 New Construction Over $200,001
Per Each $100,000 Over $200,000

3 New Construction Over $200,002
Maximum Fee Not to Exceed

4 Additions/Alterations Over $5,000

U. MISCELLANEOUS ENGINEERING REVIEW
1 Regular Operating Hours

2 Overtime

V. PLAN CHECK AND INSPECTION FOR SITE DEVELOPMENT NOT
RELATED TO ANY OTHER REQUIRED PERMIT (EFFECTIVE JULY 30, 2002)
1 Application Fee

2 Plan check and/or Inspection Fee During Regular Work Hours

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

90.00 Permit

113.00 Permit

750.00+61% Report +
Of
Building

3,000.00+6 Report +
1% Of

Building

145.00 Permit

73.00 Permit

14,563.00 Permit

145.00 Permit

110.00 Hour or
Fraction of

160.00 Hour or
Fraction of

59.00 Permit

95.00 Hour or
Fraction of

94.00 Permit

118.00 Permit

780.00+61% Report +
Of
Building

3,120.00+61 Report +
Of
Building

151.00 Permit

76.00 Permit

15,146.00 Permit

151.00 Permit

114.00 Hour or
Fraction of

166.00 Hour or
Fraction of

61.00 Permit

99.00 Hour or
Fraction of

4.44%

4.42%

4.00%

4.00%

4.14%

4.11%

4.00%

4.14%

3.64%

3.75%

3.39%

4.21%

!<*'"'__
C'itv Connril SjKX'ial Session

.him- S. 2OOO



ATTACHMENT A

1 it > of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Effective: .liih I. 2OOO

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

COMMERCIAL & RESIDENTIAL LENDING

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

^-RESIDENTIAL LOAN PROCESSING/ORIGINATION/APPLICATION FEE HOMEOWNERSHIP PROGRAM FEE
4 2Q3K §£%—Lean

A mount

31_ FTHB Loan Application Fee

4—HMIP Loan Application-Fee

5—loan Fee

220.00 Loan

83r0Q—Lea*

4^0%—Lean

Deleted

Deleted

Up to 250.00 Loan

Deleted

Deleted

13.64%

MISCELLANEOUS
B. DUPLICATION OF ANY DOCUMENTS

2 Documents Not Routinely Produced in Multiple Copies for Distribution

REAL, ESTATE
A. PROCESS FEE

1 Administrative Processing Fee for Surplus Property (Planning Commission)

2 Administrative Processing Fee for the Sale of Substandard Surplus City Parcels

4 Processing Fee for Code Compliance Litigation Guarantees - Residential

5 Processing Fee for Code Compliance Litigation Guarantees - Commercial

6 Processing Fee for Appraisals
a. Residential Properties

0.06 Page

157.00 or Reporter
10% of Actual

Cost of
Litigation

343.00 Appraisal

0.10 Page

172.70 or Report or
of Actual
Cost of
Litigation

377.30 Appraisal

66.67%

1,004.00

1,505.00

94.00 or 10%

Parcel

Parcel

Report or
of Actual
Cost of
Litigation

1104.40

1,655.50

103.40 or

Parcel

Parcel

Report or
of Actual
Cost of
Litigation

10.00%

10.00%

10.00%

10.00%

10.00%

Item __

t it v ( oiim-il Spi-oiid Session
-him S.-JOOII



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
i:Heethe:.hih 1.2OOO

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

A. PROCESS FEE
6 Processing Fee for Appraisals

b. Commercial Properties

7 Administrative Processing Fee for new telecommunication leases or licenses

B. EASEMENT REVIEW FEE

RESIDENTIAL- RENT ADJUSTMENT
C. ELLIS ACT FEE

1 Application fee to withdraw rental unit from rental market

PLANNING «fe ZONING
A. APPLICATIONS UNDER THE OAKLAND ZONING REGULATIONS (42511)

1 Major Conditional Use Permit
a. Site Area 15,000 Sq. Ft. or Less

b. Site Area Over 15,000 Sq. Ft.

c. Notification Fee: Major Conditional Use Permit

2 Major Variance
a. Site Area 15,000 Sq. Ft. or Less

b. Site Area over 15,000 Sq. Ft.

c. Notification Fee: Major Variance

3 Rezoning
a. Rezoning

b. Notification Fee: Rezoning

4 Planned Unit Development (Preliminary)
a. Basic Fee

b. Plus Per 10,000 Sq. Ft. of Site Area Over Four (4) Acres

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

572.00 Appraisal

1,650.00 Request

1,255.00 Each

275.00 Unit

629.20 Appraisal

1,815.00 Request

1,347.50 Each

250.00 Unit

10.00%

10.00%

7.37%

-9.09%

1 ,505.00

2,530.00

555.00

1,505.00

2,530.00

555.00

2,290.00

710.00

4,230.00

29.00

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

10,000
Sq. Ft.

1 ,565.00

2,631.00

577.00

1,565.00

2,631.00

577.00

2,382.00

738.00

4,399.00

30.00

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

10,000
Sq. Ft.

3.99%

3.99%

3.96%

3.99%

3.99%

3.96%

4.02%

3.94%

4.00%

3.45%

City Couiifil S(K-»-iJiI Session
.htm-S.20O(i



ATTACHMENT A

of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

1,200«

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

A. APPLICATIONS UNDER THE OAKLAND ZONING REGULATIONS (42511)
4 Planned Unit Development (Preliminary)

d. Notification Fee: Planned Unit Development (Preliminary)

5 Planned Unit Development (Final)
a. Basic Fee

c. Notification Fee: Planned Unit Development: Final Planning Commission

6 Minor Variance
a. Except 1-2 Units Not Involving Building Envelope

b. 1-2 Units Not Involving Building Envelope

c. Notification Fee: Minor Variance

7 Minor Conditional Use Permit
a. Except 1-2 Units Not Involving Building Envelope

b. 1-2 Units Not Involving Building Envelope

c. Notification Fee: Minor Conditional Use Permit

8 Design Review
a. Work Value $150,000 or Less

b. Work Value Over $150,000

c. Notification Fee: Design Review (Except for Landmarks) No Public Hearing

d. Notification Fee: Design Review (Except for Landmarks) with Public Hearing

9 Minor Design Review

10 Special Residential Design Review
a. New Construction

b. Additions and Alterations

c. Exemption Determination

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

555.00 Report 577.00 Report 3.96%

3,420.00

555.00

831 .00

296.00

540.00

831.00

296.00

540.00

832.00

2,193.00

540.00

555.00

296.00

630.00

433.00

150.00

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

3,557.00

577.00

864.00

308.00

562.00

864.00

308.00

562.00

864.00

2,281.00

562.00

577.00

308.00

655.00

450.00

156.00

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

4.01%

3.96%

3.97%

4.05%

4.07%

3.97%

4.05%

4.07%

3.85%

4.01%

4.07%

3.96%

4.05%

3.97%

3.93%

4.00%

Item _
('it* t'uiiiH'il Special Session

JiuioS. 20O(>



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Effective: Juh I. 2OOO

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

A. APPLICATIONS UNDER THE OAKLAND ZONING REGULATIONS (42511)
11 R-36 ZONE DESIGN REVIEW

a. Basic Fee - Work Value Over $150,000

b. Notification Fee

c. Environmental Determination

d. Basic Fee - Work Value Under $150,000

12 S-11 Site Development and Design Review
a. Application Fees

1 Review of Improvements to Existing Dwelling

2 Addition Does Not Involve Building Envelope

3 New Single Family Dwelling on a Single Lot

4 Two New Single Family Dwellings on a Single Lot

5 Three New Single Family Dwellings on a Single Lot

6 Each Additional New Single Family Dwelling Over Three

7 Review of Subdivision, Parcel Map or Community Driveway Proposal
Devised to Serve two New Single Family Dwelling

8 Review of Subdivision, Parcel Map or Community Driveway Proposal
Devised to Serve Three New Single Family Dwellings

9 Review of Subdivision, Parcel Map or Community Driveway Proposal
Devised to Serve Each New Single Family Dwellings Over Three

b. Special Fees
1 North Oakland Hill Area Specific Plan Recovery Fee Per Dwelling

2 S-11 Notice Publication Fee

3 S-11 Special Mail Handling Fee

c. Notification Fee: S-11 Site Development and Design
1 Notification Fee: S-11 Site Development and Design

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

832.00

555.00

150.00

433.00

864.00

433.00

2,193.00

4,096.00

4,582.00

250.00

4,096.00

4,628.00

250.00

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

865.00

577.00

156.00

450.00

899.00

439.00

2.281.00

4,260.00

4,765.00

260.00

4,260.00

4,813.00

260.00

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

3.97%

3.96%

4.00%

3.93%

4.05%

1 .39%

4.01%

4.00%

3.99%

4.00%

4.00%

4.00%

4.00%

207.00 Report

64.00 Application

13.00 Application

555.00 Report

215.00 Report

67.00 Application

14.00 Application

577.00 Report

3.86%

4.69%

7.69%

3.96%

'flJSC --IO
Cit.vC'oiiiH'tl Special Session



ATTACHMENT A

C itv of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

A. APPLICATIONS UNDER THE OAKLAND ZONING REGULATIONS (42511)
12 S-11 Site Development and Design Review

c. Notification Fee: S-11 Site Development and Design
2 Wo Public Hearing

13 S-14 Expedited Design and Bulk Review
a. New Construction

b. Notification Fee: S-14 Design and Bulk Review (Additions and Alterations)

c. Additions and Alterations

d. Notification Fee: S-14 Design and Bulk Review (Additions and Alterations)

e. Notification Fee: S-14 Administrative Review of Retaining Walls

f. Exemption Determination

14 Development Agreement
a. Notification Fee: Development Agreement

b. Development Agreement

15 Development Agreement: Annual Review

16 Appeals
a. Administrative Appeal

b. To City Planning Commission (CPC)

c. To City Council

d. Billboard Amortization

e. Notification Fee: Appeals to Planning Commission

f. Notification Fee: Appeals to City Council

17 Requests
a. For Extension of Time

b. For Discretionary Waiver

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

555.00 Report 577.00 Report 3.96%

2,130.00

540.00

433.00

540.00

225.00

150.00

710.00

7,555.00

2,287.00

494.00

225.00

225.00

350.00

370.00

370.00

238.00

110.00

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Appeal

Appeal

Appeal

Report

Report

Request

Request

2,215.00

562.00

450.00

562.00

234.00

156.00

738.00

7,857.00

2,378.00

514.00

234.00

234.00

364.00

385.00

385.00

248.00

114.00

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Appeal

Appeal

Appeal

Report

Report

Request

Request

3.99%

4.07%

3.93%

4.07%

4.00%

4.00%

3.94%

4.00%

3.98%

4.05%

4.00%

4.00%

4.00%

4.05%

4.05%

4.20%

3.64%

'iiije il
City C'onnril Special Si-ssion

-him-S. 2000



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Eil*cctivc:.liil.>

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

A. APPLICATIONS UNDER THE OAKLAND ZONING REGULATIONS (42511)
17 Requests

c. For Reduction of Off-Street Parking Requirements

d. For CPC Reconsideration of Conditions of Approval

18 Business Tax Certificate

19 General Plan Amendment
a. Notification Fee: Request for General Plan Amendment

b. General Plan Amendment

21 Application Notification Fee
a. Major Conditional Use Permit

b. Major Variance

c. Rezoning

d. Development Agreement

e. Tentative Map

f. Request for General Plan Amendment

g. Private Access Easement

h. Minor Variance

i. Minor Conditional Use Permit

j. Appeals to City Council

k. Request for Environmental Review

I. Parcel Map

m. Planned Unit Development: Preliminary Planning Commission Action

n. Planned Unit Development: Final Planning Commission Action

o. S-11 Site Development and Design Review: No Public Hearing

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

110.00

238.00

22.00

555.00

2,220.00

555.55

555.00

710.00

710.00

555.00

555.00

443.00

473.00

473.00

370.00

370.00

540.00

555.00

555.00

555.00

Request

Request

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

114.00

248.00

23.00

577.00

2,309.00

577.00

577.00

738.00

738.00

577.00

577.00

461.00

492.00

492.00

385.00

385.00

562.00

577.00

577.00

577.00

Request

Request

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

3.64%

4.20%

4.55%

3.96%

4.01%

3.86%

3.96%

3.94%

3.94%

3.96%

3.96%

4.06%

4.02%

4.02%

4.05%

4.05%

4.07%

3.96%

3.96%

3.96%

Citv C'ni i f i f i l S|K-Hal Session
JUIK- S. 2000



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
EttcctiYc:.liih l.2

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION
A. APPLICATIONS UNDER THE OAKLAND ZONING REGULATIONS (42511)

21 Application Notification Fee
p. S-11 Site Development and Design

q. Appeals to Planning Commission

r. Design Review (Except for Landmarks) No Public Hearing

s. Design Review (Except for Landmarks) with Public Hearing

t. Challenge to Negative Declaration

u. Appeal of Director's Determination that EIR is Required

v. S-14 Design and Bulk Review (New Construction)

w. S-14 Design and Bulk Review (Additions and Alterations)

x. S-14 Administrative Review of Retaining Walls

B. APPLICATIONS UNDER THE OAKLAND SUBDIVISION REGULATIONS
1 Tentative Map (In Connection with Planned Unit Development or Use Permit)

2 All Other Tentative Maps (Other than Condominium Conversions)
a. Basic Fee

b. Surcharge (Per Lot)

3 Private Access Easement
a. Notification Fee: Private Access Easement

b. Private Access Easement

4 Tentative Parcel Map

5 Parcel Map Waiver

6 Condominium Conversion: Parcel Map

7 Condominium Conversion: Tentative Map

8 Request for Extension of Time Limits

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

555.00

370.00

540.00

555.00

370.00

370.00

540.00

540.00

225.00

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

577.00

385.00

562.00

577.00

385.00

385.00

562.00

562.00

234.00

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

3.96%

4.05%

4.07%

3.96%

4.05%

4.05%

4.07%

4.07%

4.00%

4,150.00 Report 4,316.00 Report 4.00%

4,185.00

75.00

443.00

2,607.00

1,940.00

560.00

2,353.00

4,258.00

225.00

Report

Lot

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

4,352.40

78.00

461.00

2,711.00

2,018.00

582.00

2,447.00

4,428.00

234.00

Report

Lot

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

4.00%

4.00%

4.06%

3.99%

4.02%

3.93%

3.99%

3.99%

4.00%

C'it* Ouim-il Special Session
. 2<M»>



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

A. APPLICATIONS UNDER THE OAKLAND ZONING REGULATIONS (42511)
21 Application Notification Fee

p. S-11 Site Development and Design

q. Appeals to Planning Commission

r. Design Review (Except for Landmarks) No Public Hearing

s. Design Review (Except for Landmarks) with Public Hearing

t. Challenge to Negative Declaration

u. Appeal of Director's Determination that EIR is Required

v. S-14 Design and Bulk Review (New Construction)

w. S-14 Design and Bulk Review (Additions and Alterations)

x. S-14 Administrative Review of Retaining Walls

B. APPLICATIONS UNDER THE OAKLAND SUBDIVISION REGULATIONS
1 Tentative Map (In Connection with Planned Unit Development or Use Permit)

2 All Other Tentative Maps (Other than Condominium Conversions)
a. Basic Fee

b. Surcharge (Per Lot)

3 Private Access Easement
a. Notification Fee: Private Access Easement

b. Private Access Easement

4 Tentative Parcel Map

5 Parcel Map Waiver

6 Condominium Conversion: Parcel Map

7 Condominium Conversion: Tentative Map

8 Request for Extension of Time Limits

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

555.00

370.00

540.00

555.00

370.00

370.00

540.00

540.00

225.00

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

577.00

385.00

562.00

577.00

385.00

385.00

562.00

562.00

234.00

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

3.96%

4.05%

4.07%

3.96%

4.05%

4.05%

4.07%

4.07%

4.00%

4,150.00 Report 4,316.00 Report 4.00%

4,185.00

75.00

443.00

2,607.00

1 ,940.00

560.00

2,353.00

4,258.00

225.00

Report

Lot

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

4,352.40

78.00

461.00

2,711.00

2,018.00

582.00

2,447.00

4,428.00

234.00

Report

Lot

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

Report

4.00%

4.00%

4.06%

3.99%

4.02%

3.93%

3.99%

3.99%

4.00%

C'il.v ( oiiiM-il S|K-<-i:il Session
S. 200<t



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

1.2OO«

COMMUMTY AXD
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

B. APPLICATIONS UNDER THE OAKLAND SUBDIVISION REGULATIONS
9 Application Notification Fee

3. Tentative Map

b. Parcel Map

C. REQUEST FOR ENVIRONMENTAL IMPACT ASSESSMENT (42513)
1 Request for Environmental Determination (If Project is Exempt)

a. Standard Exemption such as 15301 and other exemption not requiring findings

b. Request for Environmental Review (If Project is exempt under California Code
15280, 15332, or other Exemption Requiring Findings)

c. Request for Environmental Review (If Project is exempt but requires analysis
and/or findings equivalent to an initial study)

Request for Environmental Review (If Project is Not Exempt)
a. Request for Environmental Review (If Project is Not Exempt)

b. Notification Fee: Request for Environmental Review

3 Environmental Review Processing Fee-EIR

Challenge or Appeal of any Environmental Determination
a. To City Planning Commission

b. To City Council

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

555.00 Report

540.00 Report

150.00 Exemption
Determination

555.00 Exemption
Determination

577.00 Report

562.00 Report

156.00 Exemption
Determination

577.00 Exemption
Determination

Greater of: Exemption Greater of: Exemption
$1,100 or Determination $1,144 or Determination

25% of 25% of
consultant fee consultant fee

Greater of:
$1,100 or

25% of
consultant

fee

Initial Greater of: Initial
$1,144 or

25% of
consultant fee

3.96%

4.07%

4.00%

3.96%

4.00%

4.00%

370.00

25%

425.00

425.00

Report

EIR
Consultant
Fee,
Minimum
of $10,400

Appeal

Appeal

385.00

28%

442.00

442.00

Report

EIR
Consultant
Fee,
Minimum
of $10.400

Appeal

Appeal

4.05%

12.00%

4.00%

4.00%

l»:uie if
C itv ( uniH'il S|k-viiil Session

.hiiK',S,'2OOO



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Seliednle

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

C. REQUEST FOR ENVIRONMENTAL IMPACT ASSESSMENT (42513)
4 Challenge or Appeal of any Environmental Determination

c. Notification Fee: Challenge to Negative Declaration

d. Notification Fee: Appeal of Director's Determination that EIR is Required

5 Request for Notification for Environmental Determination/Review/
Challenge/Appeal (Nos. 2, 3, and 4 Above)

6 Mitigation Monitoring

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

7 Environmental Impact Data Collection, if EIR required

D. REQUEST FOR PLAN (45519)
1 General Plan

2 Redevelopment Plan

E. SUBDIVISION REGULATIONS (45519)

F. RETROFIT RIGHT PUBLICATION (cost per book) (45519)
1 Retail (1-4 Copies)

2 Wholesale (5-39 Copies)

3 Wholesale (40-119 Copies)

4 Wholesale (120+ Copies)

G. PLANNING COMMISSION AGENDA (45519)
1 Private Subscription

370.00 Report

370.00 Report

370.00 Notification

$555.00 Measure
plus

deposit
based on

77.00 hour
for

estimated
time during

6,275.00 Report

487.00 Request

New

10.00 Each

385.00 Report

385.00 Report

385.00 Notification

$577.00 plus Measure
deposit

based on
80.00 hour

for estimated
time during

6,526.00 Report

506.00 Request

506.00 + Request
mailing

10.50 Each

4.05%

4.05%

4.05%

3.96%

4.00%

3.90%

5.00%

15.00 Each

11.00 Each

10.00 Each

9.00 Each

16.00 Each

11.50 Each

10.50 Each

9.50 Each

6.67%

4.55%

5.00%

5.56%

35.00 Subscription/
Year

36.00 Subscription/
Year

2.86%

iiie i5
City CouiM'il SIKX-IU! St-ssion

.him-8.2



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

1.20O«

COMMUNITY AND
ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

I. PLANNING COMMISSION MINUTES (45519)
2 Private Subscription

J. CONDOMINIUM CONVERSION INFORMATION PACKAGE DOCUMENT

K. ANNEXATION FEE (42511)
1 Five (5) Acres or Less

a. Application Fee

b. Additional Fees

2 Greater Than Five (5) Acres

3 LAFCO Application Fee (for County)

4 Additional Fee Subsequent to LAFCO Determination

L. PLAN CHECKING AND/OR PROCESSING OF APPLICATION FOR A
PERMIT REQUIRED BY OAKLAND ZONING REGULATION, SUBDIVISION
REGULATIONS, AND/OR ENVIRONMENTAL REVIEW

1 Consultation Services Requested or Preliminary Plan Review (One Hour

a. Consultation Services Requested or Preliminary Plan Review

b. Consultation Services Requested or Prelim. Plan Review for Major Projects

2 Additional Plan Checking and/or Processing Required Due to Plan
Deficiencies or Changes (One Two Hour Minimum)

3 Consultation Services or Plan Review Requested Outside Normal Hours (One
Two Hour Minimum)

M. WRITTEN DETERMINATION BY ZONING ADMINISTRATOR (Half-hour

N. ZONING CONFIRMATION LETTER

1 Standard - No Research Required

2 Research Required

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

52.00 Year

10.00 Package

585.00 Application

90.00 Hour

15,694.00 Application

3,318.00 Application

100.00 Hour

54.00 Year

10.50 Package

608.00 Application

94.00 Hour

16,322.00 Application

3,452.00 Application

104.00 Hour

110.00

$200.00
plus

77.00/hour
over 3 hours

1,110.00

75.00

Hour

Each

Each

Hour

114.00

$208.00 plus
80.00/hour

over 3 hours

1,144.00

78.00

Hour

Each

Each

Hour

143.00 Hour

154.00 Hour

149.00 Hour

160.00 Hour

22.00

77.00

Each

Hour

23.00

80.00

Each

Hour

3.85%

5.00%

3.93%

4.44%

4.00%

4.04%

4.00%

3.64%

4.00%

3.06%

4.00%

4.20%

3.90%

4.55%

3.90%

Itt-in ___
Citv t oiiiiril S|K-cinl Session

Jtim-S. 2000



ATTACHMENT A

111;* of Oakland

Maslcr IVc Schedule

FEE DESCRIPTION

FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT
X. EXCESS LITTER FEE

1 Small Business

2 Medium Business

3 Large Business

4 Failure to File an Annual Declaration

5 Penalty for Failure to Pay Excess Litter Fee invoice within 60 Days from Due Date

6 Penalty for Failure to Pay Excess Litter Fee Invoice beyond 90 Days from Due Date

7 Penalty for Failure to Pav Excess Litter Fee Invoice beyond 120 Days from Due Date

8 Interest. Inclusive of Penalties, for Delinquent Excess Utter Fees Due

9 Filing fee for an appeal for Litter Ordinance

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

New

New

New

New

New

New

New

New

New

230.00 Per Year
(or pro-rata)

910.00 Per Year
(or pro-rata)

2.439.00 Per Year
(orpro-rata)

50.00 Per Year

10% of Invoice

25% of Invoice

50% of Invoice

1% Per Month

67.50 Appeal

PARKING MANAGEMENT
A. ON-STREET PARKING METER

4-—In the Central Business-District {From N. Side of Grand Avenue to S. Side of
Embarcadero and E -̂Sido-of-Oak Street-to W. Side of-Martin Luther King, Jr.

2—AH Areas of Oakland Except Central Business District (As Defined Above)

1.25 Space/Hour

1.00 Space/Hour

1.25 Space/Hour

4^5 — Spaco/Hour

4,25 — Spoco/Hour

0.00%

25.00%

im 17

v '.i



City of Oakland
Master Fee Seliedule

. 2OO«

FKK DESCRIPTION

A. PERMIT REQUIRED BY THE OAKLAND FIRE CODE
Aerosal Product

Aircraft Refueling Vehicles

Aircraft Repair Hangar

Asbestos Removal

Auto Wrecking Yard

6 Battery Systems

7 Bowling Pin or Alley Refinishing

8 Burning in Public Place

9 Candles and Open Flames in Assembly Area

10 Carnivals & Fairs

11 Cellulose Nitrate Film

12 Cellulose Nitrate Storage

13 Christmas Tree Lots

14 Combustible Fiber/Material Storage

15 Compressed Gases, Flammable

16 Cryogens-ln Excess

17 Dry Cleaning Plants

18 Dust-producing Operation/Woodworking

19 Evacuations Near Flammable or Combustible Liquid Pipelines

20 Explosives or Blasting Agents
a. Manufacture, Store, or Sell

ATTACHMENT A

FIRE SERVICES

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

63.55

63.55

127.09

127.09

190.65

121.00

63.55

152.52

76.26

190.65

63.55

127.09

63.55

127.09

63.55

63.55

63.55

127.09

63.55

Year

Truck/Yea

Year

Year

Year

Year

Instance

Special

Year

Instance

Year

Year

Each

Year

Year

Year

Year

Year

Instance

66.72

66.72

133.45

133.45

200.18

127.05

66.72

160.14

80.08

200.18

66.72

133.45

66.72

133.45

66.72

66.72

66.72

133.45

66.72

Year

Truck/Yea

Year

Year

Year

Year

Instance

Special

Year

Instance

Year

Year

Each

Year

Year

Year

Year

Year

Instance

4.99%

4.99%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

4.99%

5.00%

5.01%

5.00%

4.99%

5.00%

4.99%

5.00%

4.99%

4.99%

4.99%

5.00%

4.99%

63.55 Year 66.72 Year 4.99%

*'«-"'« __
Cit> I'mniHI Special Session

.him S, 200<i



City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

.2OOO

FEE DESCRIPTION

A. PERMIT REQUIRED BY THE OAKLAND FIRE CODE
20 Explosives or Blasting Agents

b. Manufacture, Store, or Sell in Excess of 100 Pounds

c. Transport

d. Operate Terminal

e. Receive or Deliver

f. Transport with Blasting Caps

21 Fireworks
a. Manufacture, Store, Possess or Sell

b. Public Display

c. Special Fee for Continuous Display

22 Flammable or Combustible Liquids & Tanks
a. Store, Handle or Use Class I Liquids

b. Store, Handle or Use Class II or Class III Liquids

c. Remove Class I or Class II Liquids from Underground Storage Tank
1 Permit Processing/Plan Check

2 Inspection

d. Install, Alter, or Operate Equipment in Connection with Storage

1 Permit Processing/Plan Check

2 Inspection

e. Install, Alter, Remove, Abandon, Etc.

1 Permit Processing/Plan Check

2 Inspection

f. Additional Tanks

ATTACHMENT A

FIRE SERVICES

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

127.09

63.55

127.09

63.55

63.55

127.09

254.20

1,270.98

127.09

127.09

404.40

219.54

127.09

404.40

439.07

127.09

404.40

439.07

127.09

Year

Instance

Year

Instance

Instance

Instance

Instance

Year

Year

Year

Permit

Inspection

Year

Permit

Inspection

Year

Permit

Inspection

Year

133.45

66.72

133.45

66.72

66.72

133.45

266.91

1334.53

133.45

133.45

424.62

230.51

133.45

424.62

461.02

133.45

424.62

461.02

133.45

Year

Instance

Year

Instance

Instance

Instance

Instance

Year

Year

Year

Permit

Inspection

Year

Permit

Inspection

Year

Permit

Inspection

Year

5.00%

4.99%

5.00%

4.99%

4.99%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

C'tt.v OoiiiH'il S|K'Hi»l Session
Jim,-S.



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Eflccthc:Jnl.> l,2

FIRE SERVICES

FEE DESCRIPTION

A. PERMIT REQUIRED BY THE OAKLAND FIRE CODE
22 Flammable or Combustible Liquids & Tanks

g. After-Hours Inspection Rate

23 Fumigation or Thermal Insecticidal Fogging

24 Garages

25 Hazardous Materials

26 Highly Toxic Pesticides

27 High Piled Combustible Stock

28 Junk Yards/Waste Material Handling Plant

29 Lumber Yards

30 Liquid Gas Fueled Vehicle/Equipment in Assembly Area

31 Liquefied Petroleum Gases
a. Install

b. Maintain

32 Magnesium Working

33 Mall, Covered:
a. Placing or Constructing Temp. Kiosks, Display Booths, Concession

b. Use Mall as Place of Assembly

c. Use Flame or Flame-producing Device

d. Display Any Liquid or Gas-fueled Powered Equipment

e. Use Liquefied Petroleum Gas, Liquefied Natural Gas and Compressed

34 Matches - Manufacture, Use, Store

35 Motor Vehicle Dispensing Stations

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

109.77

63.55

127.09

127.09

127.09

127.09

127.09

127.09

121.00

127.09

63.55

127.09

63.55

127.09

63.55

63.55

63.55

63.55

127.09

Hour

Year

Year

Year

Year

Year

Year

Year

Vehicle/In
stance

Instance

Year

Year

Instance

Instance

Instance

Instance

Instance

Year

Year

115.26

66.72

133.45

133.45

133.45

133.45

133.45

133.45

127.05

133.45

66.72

133.45

66.72

133.45

66.72

66.72

66.72

66.72

133.45

Hour

Year

Year

Year

Year

Year

Year

Year

Vehicle/In
stance

Instance

Year

Year

Instance

Instance

Instance

Instance

Instance

Year

Year

5.00%

4.99%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

4.99%

5.00%

4.99%

5.00%

4.99%

4.99%

4.99%

4.99%

5.00%

î e ."><)
City Council S|K*4»iiil Session

.Inn? S. 20OO



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule*
Effective: JiiK I.2OO«

FIRE SERVICES

FEE DESCRIPTION

A. PERMIT REQUIRED BY THE OAKLAND FIRE CODE
36 Oil & Natural Gas Wells

a. Drill, Own. Operate or Maintain

37 Open-flame Devices in Marinas
Use for Maintenance or Repair of Boats, Slips, or Wharves

b. Use Portable B.B.Q., Brazier or Cooking Device on Any Boat, Slip or Wharf

38 Organic Coatings - Mfg.

39 Ovens, Industrial Baking or Drying

40 Parade Floats

41 Places of Assembly
3. Occupant Load 50-100

b. Occupant Load 101-300

c. Occupant Load Over 300

42 Pumpkin Patch Lots

43 Pyrotechnics, Special Effects

44 Radioactive Materials

45 Refrigeration Equipment

46 Spraying or Dipping

47 Tank Vehicles - Operate

48 Tents & Air Supporter Structures

49 Tire Recapping

50 Tire Storage

51 Wood Products

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

63.55 Year 66.72 Year 4.99%

63.55

63.55

63.55

63.55

63.55

63.55

127.09

190.65

63.55

254.20

63.55

63.55

63.55

63.55

190.65

127.09

127.09

127.09

Visit

Year

Year

Year

Float/Instance

Year

Year

Year

Each

Instance

Instance

Year

Year

Instance

Structure

Year

Year

Year

66.72

66.72

66.72

66.72

66.72

66.72

133.45

200.18

66.72

266.91

66.72

66.72

66.72

66.72

200.18

133.45

133.45

133.45

Visit

Year

Year

Year

Float/Instance

Year

Year

Year

Each

Instance

Instance

Year

Year

Instance

Structure

Year

Year

Year

4.99%

4.99%

4.99%

4.99%

4.99%

4.99%

5.00%

5.00%

4.99%

5.00%

4.99%

4.99%

4.99%

4.99%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

Item _
€,'it.v Council SjK'cial Session

-Pun, S,-^



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Eflccthc:Jiil.v 1, 2OO6

FIRE SERVICES

FEK DESCRIPTION

A. PERMIT REQUIRED BY THE OAKLAND FIRE CODE
52 Welding/Hot-Works

53 Fruit Ripening Operations

B. INSTALLATION OF FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS/FIRE EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS
1 Basic Fee

2 Inspection Fee

3 Other Systems (Range Hood & Duct System, FM 200)

4 Maintenance and Inspection Fee

5 Any Retest

6 Fire Protection Engineer

D. INSPECTION FOR FIRE CLEARANCE CERTIFICATE
1 Nursery School, Child Care Center or Foster Home:

a. Under 6 Persons

b. Over 6 Persons

c. Large Family Day-Care 8-14 Children

2 Group Home, Institution for Children, Certified Family Care Home, Board &
Care Facility, or Maternity Home
a. Accommodating Not More Than 6 Persons, Not Including Employees or

b. Accommodating More Than 6 Persons, Not Including Employees or

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

127.09

127.09

404.40

439.07

127.09

109.77

109.77

83.08

31.78

50.84

50.84

63.55

63.55

Year

Year

System

Instance

System

Instance

Hour

Hour

Certificate
/Year

Certificate
/Year

Certificate
/Year

Certificate
/Year

Certificate
/Year

133.45

133.45

424.62

461.02

133.45

115.26

115.26

87.25

33.37

53.38

53.38

66.72

66.72

Year

Year

System

Instance

System

Instance

Hour

Hour

Certificate
/Year

Certificate
/Year

Certificate
/Year

Certificate
/Year

Certificate
/Year

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.02%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

4.99%

4.99%

iiiie 52
C'ity Council

I **-'»„_
inl Session



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Effective: Jnl.> I,2OO<$

FIRE SERVICES

FEE DESCRIPTION

D. INSPECTION FOR FIRE CLEARANCE CERTIFICATE
3 Convalescent Hospital, Nursing Home, Home for the Aged, Sanitarium, Jails, or

Prisons
a. Accommodating Not More Than 6 Persons, Not Including Employees or

b. Accommodating Between 6 and 100 Persons, Not Including Employees or

c. Accommodating More Than 100 Persons, Not Including Employees or

4 Hospital
a. Less Than 100 Beds

b. 100 Beds or More

5 Fire Clearance Inspections - Miscellaneous

6 Reinspection Fee

F. PHOTOGRAPHS/PRINTS
1 3-1/2" x 5" Color

2 3-1/2" x 5" Black & White

3 5"x 7" Color

4 5" x 7" Black & White

5 8"x 10" Color

6 8"x 10" Black & White

7 11" x 14" Color

8 11"x 14" Black& White

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

63.55

101.68

127.09

Certificate
/Year

Certificate
/Year

Certificate
/Year

127.09 Certificate
/Year

254.20 Certificate
/Year

99.79 inspection
/Hour

200.00 Inspection

66.72

106.77

133.45

Certificate
/Year

Certificate
/Year

Certificate
/Year

133.45 Certificate
/Year

266.91 Certificate
/Year

104.78 Inspection
/Hour

210.00 Inspection

4.99%

5.01%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

3.82

3.82

6.36

6.36

12.71

9.54

19.06

12.71

Photo

Photo

Photo

Photo

Photo

Photo

Photo

Photo

4.01

4.01

6.68

6.68

13.34

10.01

20.02

13.34

Photo

Photo

Photo

Photo

Photo

Photo

Photo

Photo

4.97%

4.97%

5.03%

5.03%

4.96%

4.93%

5.04%

4.96%

***'»'......
il* C'oiinril S|ic<-ial Session

, 20OO



ATTACHMENT A

Vc Schedule
h i. ~'<MM;

' I I I

FEE DESCRIPTION

F. PHOTOGRAPHS/PRINTS
9 16" x 20" Color

10 16"x 20"Blacks, White

11 Additional Prints

12 Color Slide Processing

H. FEE FOR COPYING COMMUNICATIONS VOICE TAPES AS ALLOWED BY
SECTION 6257 OF THE CALIFORNIA GOVERNMENT CODE AND SECTION
1563 OF THE EVIDENCE CODE

4—Photocopy Fee

OLD FEE / WIT NEW FEE/UNIT % CHANGE

21 Processing Fee (Does not apply to public records or subpoena requests)

32 Cassette Tape

3 Production of Documents in Response to Subpoenas

I. RECOVERY FOR EMERGENCY RESPONSE EXPENSES AS ALLOWED BY
CALIFORNIA GOVERNMENT CODE AND SECTIONS 35150-35157
1 Deputy Chief

2 Battalion Chief

3 Captain

4 Lieutenant

5 Engineer

6 Firefighter

7 Fire Communications Supervisor

8 Sr. Fire Communications Dispatcher

9 Fire Communications Dispatcher

10 Fire Engine Company

38.13

31.78

3.82

25.42

n "nU.̂ g

34.66

5.78

New

170.18

138.35

115.08

106.51

100.40

90.60

80.81

73.46

64.89

402.80

Photo

Photo

Photo

Each

Fr-Qf̂ htL-aOt I

Hour

Each

40.03

33.37

4.01

26.69

Deleted

36.39

6.06

Photo

Photo

Photo

Each

Hour

Each

Statutory fees
permitted By Evidence

Code Section 1563

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

178.69

145.26

120.84

1 1 1 .84

105.42

95.13

84.85

77.13

68.13

422.94

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

4.98%

5.00%

4.97%

5.00%

4.99%

4.84%

5.00%

4.99%

5.01%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

4.99%

5.00%

[((- in

( l\\ ( oliMi-i! Njift-i;ri Session

.Itt iu- S. --Tlt iMi



ATTACHMENT A

City of OakUtiid
Master Fee Schedule
i ; m r ( i v < : . l n h 1, 2OOO

FIRE SERVICES

FEE DESCRIPTION

I. RECOVERY FOR EMERGENCY RESPONSE EXPENSES AS ALLOWED BY
CALIFORNIA GOVERNMENT CODE AND SECTIONS 35150-35157
11 Fire Prevention Inspector

12 Haz Mat Engine Company

13 Truck Company (4 Person)

14 Truck Company (5 Person)

15 Captain / Paramedic

16 Lieutenant / Paramedic

17 Engineer/ Paramedic

18 Firefighter/ Paramedic - 4th year

19 Firefighter / Paramedic - 3rd year

20 Firefighter / Paramedic - 2nd year

21 Firefighter / Paramedic - 1st year

22 Firefighter / Paramedic - 12-18 months

23 Firefighter / Paramedic - 9-12 months

24 Firefighter/ Paramedic - 6-9 months

25 Firefighter/ Paramedic -1-6 months

26 Paramedic Engine Company

J. MULTI-FAMILY DWELLING INSPECTION FEE
1 Inspection Fee

2 Reinspection Fee (3rd Inspection)

3 Administrative Abatement Fee

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

100.40

427.88

405.24

503.18

118.48

109.90

103.79

95.16

92.79

89.91

87.54

83.08

78.85

70.18

65.81

383.72

87.54

158.87

444.84

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Property

105.42

448.65

425.50

528.34

124.41

115.40

108.97

99.92

97.42

94.41

91.91

87.24

82.79

73.69

69.10

402.91

91.91

166.82

467.08

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Property

5.00%

4.85%

5.00%

5.00%

5.01%

5.00%

4.99%

5.00%

4.99%

5.01%

4.99%

5.01%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

4.99%

5.00%

5.00%

!*«•«'..-
C.'iti Council Special Session

.Inm •$.



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

FIRE SERVICES

FEE DESCRIPTION

K. HIGH RISE INSPECTION PEE
1 High-rise First Inspection Fee

4 Post 7/1/74 Construction

2 High-rise Re-insoection^ee

3 Mid-rise First Inspection Fee

4 Mid-rise Re-inspection Fee

L. EMERGENCY PREPAREDNESS PLANNING
1 Private Business - Employee Training

2 Public/Non-Profit Organization - Employee Training

M. NON-CERTIFIED CPR TRAINING/FIRST AID TRAINING (COMBINED)
1 Private Business

2 Public/Non Profit Organization

N. EMERGENCY PREPAREDNESS SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT
1 CORE Module I Workbook, "Individual & Family Preparedness"

2 CORE Module II Workbook, "Developing Neighborhood Emergency Response

3 CORE Module III Workbook, "An Advanced Emergency Preparedness
Workbook for Hands-on Training"

4 CORE Workbook Set, Modules I, II and III

6—CORE FlaGhlight/Siron/Radio

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

New

New

425.24 inspection

New

103.79 Hour*
Materials

52.00 Hour +
Materials

57.77 Student/6
Maximum

57.77 Student/6
Maximum

7.51 Book

23.11 Book

23,11 Book

40.44 Set

33,44—Unit

.01 Square

Deleted

.005 Square

444.40 Inspection

.005 Square

109.00 Hour +
Materials

55.00 Hour +
Materials

61.00

61.00

Student/6
Maximum

Student/6
Maximum

8.00 Book

24.00 Book

24.00 Book

56.00 Set

5.00%

5.02%

5.77%

5.59%

5.59%

6.52%

3.85%

3.85%

38.48%

Page 5(i
Cilv t onnril Spi-fidl Session

JIIIK S,'2OO(i



titv of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Kin<• ( !><: .P . , lx 1,2000

FEE DESCRIPTION

O. HAZARDOUS MATERIAL MANAGEMENT PLAN FEES
1 Square Footage Fee

b. Each Square Foot Over 10,000

c. Minimum Square Footage Fee

d. Maximum Square Footage Fee

2 Hazardous Material Quantity Fee
a. Liquids

1 First 7,000 Gallons

2 7,001 - 35,000 Gallons

3 35,00) + Gallons

b. Solids
1 First 3,000 Pounds

2 3,001 -16,000 Pounds

3 16,001 + Pounds

c. Gases
1 First 1,000 Cubic Feet

2 1,001 -6,000 Cubic Feet

3 6,00? + Cubic Feet

4 Minimum Quantity Fee

5 Maximum Quantity Fee

3 Hazardous Material Item Fee
a. Each Hazardous Material Item

b. Minimum Fee

c. Maximum Fee

ATTACHMENT A

FIRE SERVICES

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

0.00250

69.96

6,726.05

0.0220

0.0110

0.0110

0.0330

0.0110

0.0110

0.0550

0.0110

0.0110

69.96

6,726.05

25.58

69.96

6,726.05

Square

Facility

Facility

Gallon

Gallon

Gallon

Pound

Pound

Pound

Cubic

Cubic

Cubic

Facility

Facility

Item

Facility

Facility

0.0027

73.46

7062.35

0.0231

0.0116

0.0116

0.0347

0.0116

0.0116

0.0578

0.0116

0.0116

73.46

7062.35

26.85

73.46

7062.35

Square

Facility

Facility

Gallon

Gallon

Gallon

Pound

Pound

Pound

Cubic

Cubic

Cubic

Facility

Facility

Item

Facility

Facility

8.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.45%

5.45%

5.15%

5.45%

5.45%

5.09%

5.45%

5.45%

5.00%

5.00%

4.96%

5.00%

5.00%

' il» (ntim-il S|K-ci:il Session



ATTACHMENT A

tit.v of Oakland
Master Fee 8ehedule

iil> 1, 2OO«

FIRE SERVICES

FEE DESCRIPTION

O. HAZARDOUS MATERIAL MANAGEMENT PLAN FEES
4 Annual Hazardous Material Fee Limits

a. Minimum Fee

b. Maximum Fee

5 Re-inspection Fee

6 Fee for Miscellaneous Services Not Included Above (Including Review of Risk
Management Prevention Plans)

8 Spills, Leaks and Contaminated Sites Oversight Deposit

9 Spills, Leaks and Contaminated Sites Oversight (Hourly Fee)

10 Spills, Leaks and Contaminated Sites Oversight (Charge per Case)

P. UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANKS
1 One Tank

2 Two Tanks

3 Three Tanks

4 Four Tanks

5 Five Tanks

6 Six Tanks

7 Seven Tanks

8 Eight Tanks

9 Nine Tanks

10 Ten Tanks

11 Eleven Tanks

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

208.48

!0, 178.72

109.77

109.77

5,500.00

181.50

385.00

266.90

396.55

527.46

662.18

766.40

91 1 .30

1,030.66

1,150.24

1,268.67

1,388.84

1,499.76

Facility

Facility

Hour or
Fraction of

Hour or
Fraction of

Case

Hour

Case

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

218.90

21187.65

115.26

115.26

5775.00

190.58

404.25

280.25

416.38

553.83

695.29

804.72

956.86

1082.19

1207.75

1332.11

1458.28

1574.75

Facility

Facility

Hour or
Fraction of

Hour or
Fraction of

Case

Hour

Case

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

{ itv C'ti i i iH'il Sjicrkil Session
.Imi, S.'J



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Foe ^Schedule
Kftccti\c: Jnh I,

FIRE SERVICES

FEE DESCRIPTION
P. UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANKS

12 Twelve Tanks

13 Thirteen Tanks

14 Fourteen Tanks

15 Fifteen Tanks

16 Sixteen Tanks

17 Seventeen Tanks

18 Eighteen Tanks

19 Nineteen Tanks

20 Twenty Tanks

21 Over Twenty Tanks

Q. ON-SITE TREATMENT OF HAZARDOUS WASTE
1 Permit by Rule

2 Conditional Authorized

3 Conditional Exemption and Commercial Laundry
a. First Year

b. Second and Succeeding Years

R. HAZARDOUS WASTE GENERATOR
1 Self Employed Generator

2 One to Four Employees

3 Five to Nine Employees

4 Ten to Nineteen Employees

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

1,600.17

1,703.12

1,811.15

1,916.64

2,019.59

2,127.63

2,233.12

2,339.89

2,442.84

2,442.84

1,595.66

1 ,595.66

127.09

63.55

254.20

266.90

293.48

587.19

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit +
82.00 Per
Add'l Tank

Facility

Facility

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

1680.18

1788.27

1901.71

2012.47

2120.57

2234.01

2344.78

2456.88

2564.98

2564.98

1675.44

1675.44

133.45

66.72

266.91

280.25

308.15

616.55

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit +
94.71 Per
Add'l Tank

Facility

Facility

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

4.99%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

iEv Si)
Citv ( unnril S|«-<'inl Session

.Inm-S. 2



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Sehedule

FIRE SERVICES

FEE DESCRIPTION

R. HAZARDOUS WASTE GENERATOR
5 Twenty to Forty-Nine Employees

6 Fifty to Ninety-Nine Employees

7 One Hundred to Four Hundred Ninety-Nine Employees

8 Over Four Hundred Ninety-Nine

S. UNIFORM FIRE CODE INSPECTION AND COMPLIANCE FEES
1 Fire Hazard Clearance - Administrative Fee

2 Reinspection

T. SECURITY BAR PERMIT FEES
1 Existing Bedroom Window Security Bar Installations

a. First Unit

b. Second Unit

c. Three or More Units

2 New installations On Existing Buildings
a. First Unit

b. Second Unit

c. Three or More Units

3 Certification of Compliance - Contractor Certified Installations
a. Permit Fee - First Unit

b. Permit Fee - Two or More Units

4 Investigation Fees
a. Investigation Fee - Administrative Costs

b. Investigation Fee Per Work Hour or Fraction of an Hour

5 Reinspection Fees Per Work Hour or Fraction of an Hour

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

880.79

1,176.93

1,764.13

2,647.46

404.40

231.09

64.70

23.11

23.11

64.70

23.11

23.11

28.89

11.55

231.09

75.11

75.11

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Property

Property

Permit

Each

Each

Permit

Each

Each

Permit

Each

Each

Hour

Hour

924.83

1235.78

1852.33

2779.83

424.62

242.64

67.94

24.27

24.27

67.94

24.27

24.27

30.33

12.13

242.64

78.86

78.86

Permit

Permit

Permit

Permit

Property

Property

Permit

Each

Each

Permit

Each

Each

Permit

Each

Each

Hour

Hour

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.01%

5.02%

5.02%

5.01%

5.02%

5.02%

4.98%

5.02%

5.00%

4.99%

4.99%

jte (SO
C'if v Council Special Session

S. 204MI



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Heh
Effective: Juh 1, 2OO«

FIRE SERVICES

FEE INSCRIPTION

U. COMMERCIAL INSPECTION FEE

V. CONFINED SPACE FEES
1 Confined Space Training

2 Confined Space Recovery

W. MINIMUM AFTER HOUR INSPECTION FEE

X. AED CLASS

Y. FIRST AID &CPR CLASSES

Z. FIRST AID CLASS

AA. HEALTHCARE PROVIDER CLASS

AB. HEARTSAVER CPR CLASS

1 (3) Paramedic Classes

2 EMT Certification

AC. FALSE ALARM PENALTIES-COMMERCIAL ON THE SECOND
TRANSMISSION WITHIN 6 MONTHS

AD. FALSE ALARM PENALTIES-RESIDENTIAL ON THE THIRD
TRANSMISSION WITHIN 6 MONTHS

AF. TRAINING FEE-ON SITE

AG. TRAINING FEE-OFF SITE

FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

79.20 Hour 83.16 Hour 5.00%

288.86

2,310.88

225.50

49.50

49.50

38.50

38.50

27.50

154.92

35.00

429.00

Class

Incident

2.5 Hours

Person

Person

Person

Person

Person

Class

Certificati

Incidence

303.30

2426.42

236.78

51.98

51.98

40.43

40.43

28.88

162.67

36.75

450.45

Class

Incident

2.5 Hours

Person

Person

Person

Person

Person

Class

Certificati

Incidence

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

5.01%

5.01%

5.01%

5.01%

5.02%

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

429.00 Incidence

65.00 Person/Day

100.00 Person/Day

450.45 Incidence

68.25 Person/Day

105.00 Person/Day

5.00%

5.00%

5.00%

*n«£e (il
Oit.v Council S|K'ci«l Session



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Effective: J

PARKS AXD RECREATION

FEE DESCRIPTION

RECREATION SERVICES
A. AQUATICS

1 Boat Rental Rates Every Day 9 a.m. - 3:30 p.m. (Until 8 p.m. During the Summer)
r. Laser Sailing Club Pass Card

2 Tour Boat Charters
d, Tallship Adventure Sail

1 Adult

2 Youth

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

Lake Sailing/Boating Instruction Classes
a. Small Boat Basic/Introductory, Residents

3 Parent/Youth Sailing
a. Parent

b. Youth

After School Sailing

c.

h.

Mariner Day Camps
5 Residents • Tallship/Sailing Camp

6 Non-residents • Tallship/Sailing Camp

7 Residents - Advanced Keelboat Camp (5) Estuary

8 Non-Residents - Advanced Keelboat Camp @ Estuary

Open Water Sailing/Boating
1 Advanced Small Boat

b. Non-residents

Laser Clinic

m. Youth Dragonboatina

New

New

New

100.00 Adult+ (2)
Child/Course

see above

New

New

New

New

New

New

New

New

100.00 Card (10 Uses)

45.00 Person/Session

30.00 Person/Session

80.00 Course

20.00 Course

120.00 Person/Session

175.00 Person/Session

185.00 Person/Session

300.00 Person/Session

310.00 Person/Session

135.00 Person/Class

50.00 Person/Session

5.00 Person/Session

-20.00%

20.00%

<'it\ Council SjK-i-ial
.him H, 2001.



City of Oakland
Master Fee iSchedule

FEE DESCRIPTION

B. CAMPS

b.

Family Camps
a. Residents - Regular (Lodging and Meals)

1 Adult (20+)

2 Teen (12-19 Yrs)

3 School-aged (6-11 Years)

6 WooklyRato Chartorod BUG Travel

Non-residents - Regular (Lodging and Meals)
1 Adult (20+)

2 Teen (13-19 Yrs)

3 School-aged (6-12 Years)

4 Pre-School (2-5 Years)

Residents/Non-residents - Transient (Lodging and Meals)
1 Adult (20+)

2 Teen (13 -19 Yrs)

3 School-aged (6-12 Years)

4 Pre-School (2-5 Years)
Additional Miscellaneous Rates
4 Sfaff Spouse/Dependent Meal Charge

e.

2 Wrangler Meal Charge

C. CLASSES/PROGRAMS/SPECIAL EVENTS
1 Cultural Arts Classes - Studio One

a. Residents

b. Non-residents

c. Senior Citizens or Disabled

d. Teens

ATTACHMENT A

PARKS AND RECREATION

OLD FEE/UNIT NEW FEE/UNIT % CHANGE

47.00 Person/Day

42.00 Person/Day

37.00 Person/Day

175.00 — Person/Week

52.00 Person/Day

47.00 Person/Day

42.00 Person/Day

37.00 Person/Day

57.00 Person/Day

52.00 Person/Day

47.00 Person/Day

42.00 Person/Day

6rQO — Person/Meal

?LQ© — porcon/Mool

51 .00 Person/Day 8.51 %

40.00 Person/Day -4.76%

41.00 Person/Day 10.81%

Deleted

57.00 Person/Day 9.62%

51.00 Person/Day 8.51%

46.00 Person/Day 9.52%

40.00 Person/Day 8.1 1 %

62.00 Person/Day 8.77%

57.00 Person/Day 9.62%

51.00 Person/Day 8.51%

46.00 Person/Day 9.52%

Deleted

Deleted

6.00 Week/Class

6.25 Week/Class

3.00 Week/Class

3.00 Week/Class

12.00 Week/Class 100.00%

12.25 Week/Class 96.00%

9.00 Week/Class 200.00%

9.00 Week/Class 200.00%

( itv ( oiitiril Special
.Imir S.



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
EHcrti\c:Jul\

PARKS AND RECREATION

FEE DESCRIPTION

E. GOLF
1
a.

Chabot Golf Course General Admission
Standard Eighteen-Hole Course {* A $1.00 Green Fee is Collected for a
Bucket of Range Balls Which is Provided to Golfer)
1 Monday - Thursday, Before 3:00p.m. 2:00 p.m.

2 Monday - Friday, AfterSp.nh 2p.m.

4 Monday-Friday, After 1 pm, Resident Youth (Under 19 Years)

5 Saturday, Sunday or Holiday, After 3:00 pm 2:00 pm

b. Non-Resident (inctuding-fadays)

6 Saturday, Sunday or Holiday, Before 3:00 pm 2:00 om

b. Non-Resident (including Fridays)

b. Nine-Hole Course
1 Adult (Any Day, Including Holidays)

Chabot Golf Course Miscellaneous (These fees included for information only)
a. Golf Carts

1 Monday-Friday

2 Saturday, Sunday or Holiday

Single Rider

-Senior (Ovor 60)

-Senior, Single Ridor

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

desc only

desc only

25.00%4.00 Person/Round 5.00 Person/Round

30.00 Person/Round 30.00 Person/Round

37.00 Person/Round 37.00 Person/Round

6.00 Person/Round 8.00 Person/Round

22.00 Cart/Round

22.00 Cart/Round

12.00 Person/Round

18.00—Person/Round

&00—Porson/Round

26.00 Cart/Round

26.00 Cart/Round

15.00 Person/Round

Deleted

Deleted

desc only

desc only

33.33%

18.18%

18.18%

25.00%

b. Driving Range
Bucket of Balls
a. Regular

b. Large

3.00 Bucket

5.00 Bucket

4.00 Bucket

6.00 Bucket

33.33%

20.00%

il^e (»I
C.'it* CoiiiH'H Special St-ssion

.him S, 200(1



ATTACHMENT A

Utv of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
KfTccthe: Jnb I, 20OO

PARKS AND RECREATION

FEE DESCRIPTION

E. GOLF
3 Montclair Golf Course General Admission (These fees are included for

information only)
a. Pitch & Putt - 9 Holes

1 Monday - Thursday

2 Friday, Saturday, Sunday and Holidays

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

b. Driving Range - Bucket of Balls
1 Smalt

2 Medium

3 Large

F. METROPOLITAN GOLF
4 Resident

a. Monday - Thursday
18 Holes 'Daytime' without cart

b.

18 Holes 'Daytime'with cart

18 Holes ' Super Twilight' without cart { Super Twilight begins at 3:00
p.m. during non daylight savings time (PST) and at 5:00 p.m. during

8 18 Holes ' Super Twilight' with cart

Friday
4 18 Holes 'Daytime'with cart

5 18 Holes 'Twilight' without cart (Twilight begins at 1:00 p.m. during non
daylight savings time (PST) and at 3:00 p.m. during daylight savings time

6 18 Holes 'Twilight' with cart

7 18 Holes ' Super Twilight' without cart { Super Twilight begins at 3:00
p.m. during non daylight savings time (PST) and at 5:00 p.m. during

8 18 Holes ' Super Twilight' with cart

12 18 Holes ' Before 10:00 a.m. Special' without cart

3.00

4.00

3.00

4.00

5.00

28.00

42.00

19.00

Person

Person

Bucket

Bucket

Bucket

Cart

Cart

Cart

5.00

6.00

5.00

6.50

8.00

30.00

45.00

16.00

Person

Person

Bucket

Bucket

Bucket

Cart

Cart

Cart

66.67%

50.00%

66.67%

62.50%

60.00%

7.14%

7.14%

-15.79%

29.00 Cart 26.00 Cart -10.34%

64.00

29.00

39.00

27.00

37.00

28.00

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

65.00

30.00

40.00

25.00

35.00

30.00

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

1.56%

3.45%

2.56%

-7.41%

-5.41%

7.14%

1 '<•"'_
C'itv C'omiril S|ie<-ial Session



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

PARKS AND RECREATION

FEE DESCRIPTION

F. METROPOLITAN GOLF
4 Resident

b. Friday
13 18 Holes ' Before 10:00 a.m. Special' with cart

c. Weekends/Holidays
1 9 Holes without cart

2 9 Holes with cart

4 18 Holes 'Daytime'with cart

5 18 Holes 'Twilight' without cart {Twilight begins at 1:00 p. m. during non
daylight savings time (PST) and at 3:00 p.m. during daylight savings time

6 18 Holes 'Twilight' with cart

7 18 Holes ' Super Twilight' without cart { Super Twilight begins at 3:00
p.m. during non daylight savings time (PST) and at 5:00 p.m. during

8 18 Holes ' Super Twilight' with cart

10 18 Holes Junior (age 18 and under) with cart

12 18 Holes ' First hour of tee times Special'with cart

5 Non-Resident
a. Monday - Thursday

9 Holes without cart

OLD PEE / UNIT NEW PEE / UNIT % CHANGE

9 Holes with cart

18 Holes 'Daytime' without cart

18 Holes 'Daytime' with cart

18 Holes 'Twilight'without cart {Twilight begins at 1:00 p.m. during non
daylight savings time (PST) and at 3:00p.m. during daylight savings time

18 Holes 'Twilight' with cart

42.00 Cart 45.00 Cart 7.14%

29.00

39.00

74.00

29.00

39.00

27.00

37.00

40.00

69.00

21.00

31.00

38.00

52.00

27.00

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

21.00

31.00

75.00

30.00

40.00

25.00

35.00

35.00

70.00

16.00

26.00

40.00

55.00

25.00

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

-27.59%

-20.51%

1 .35%

3.45%

2.56%

-7.41%

-5.41%

-12.50%

1 .45%

-23.81%

-16.13%

5.26%

5.77%

-7.41%

37.00 Cart 35.00 Cart -5.41%

Page* <H>
( i t* Oimiril Special Session



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Effective: .lull 1, 2O<MJ

PARKS AND RECREATION

FEE DESCRIPTION

F. METROPOLITAN GOLF
5 Non-Resident

a. Monday - Thursday
7 18 Holes ' Super Twilight' without cart {Super Twilight begins at 3:00

p.m. during non daylight savings time (PST) and at 5:00 p.m. during

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

b.

c.

10

18 Holes ' Super Twilight' with cart

18 Holes Junior (age 18 and under) with cart

Friday
4 18 Holes 'Daytime'with cart

7 18 Holes ' Super Twilight' without cart { Super Twilight begins at 3:00
p.m. during non daylight savings time (PST) and at 5:00 p.m. during

8 18 Holes ' Super Twilight' with cart

10 18 Holes Junior (age 18 and under) with cart

Weekends/Holidays
1 9 Holes without cart

2 9 Holes with cart

4 18 Holes 'Daytime' with cart

7 18 Holes ' Super Twilight' without cart { Super Twilight begins at 3:00
p.m. during non daylight savings time (PST) and at 5:00 p.m. during

8 18 Holes ' Super Twilight' with cart

10 18 Holes Junior (age 18 and under) with can

22.00 Cart 20.00 Cart -9.09%

32.00

25.00

64.00

32.00

42.00

25.00

32.00

42.00

74.00

32.00

42.00

40.00

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

30.00

30.00

65.00

30.00

40.00

30.00

25.00

35.00

75.00

30.00

40.00

35.00

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

Cart

-6.25%

20.00%

1 .56%

-6.25%

-4.76%

20.00%

-21 .88%

-16.67%

1 .35%

-6.25%

-4.76%

-12.50%

I it v Council S|K'CUil Scssiun
.him-S. 2000



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
.Master Fee Schedule

, 2OO«

POLICE SERVICES

FEE DESCRIPTION

A. DOG LICENSE AS REQUIRED BY OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE SECTION
1 1 Year

2 2 Years

3 3 Years

B. DOG LICENSE FOR DOG BELONGING TO SENIOR CITIZEN AS REQUIRED
BY OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE SECTION 3-9.02

1 1 Year

2 2 Years

3 3 Years

C. DOG LICENSE FOR A SPAYED OR NEUTERED DOG AS ALLOWED BY
OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE SECTION 3-9.02

2 2 Years

3 3 Years

D. DOG LICENSE FOR SPAYED OR NEUTERED DOG BELONGING TO
SENIOR CITIZEN AS ALLOWED BY OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE SECTION 3-9.02

2 2 Years

3 3 Years

G. PENALTY FEE FOR FAILURE TO RENEW DOG LICENSE FEE WITHIN 30
DAYS FOR A DOG PREVIOUSLY LICENSED IN OAKLAND, AS REQUIRED
BY OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE SECTION 3-9.02

Q. REDEMPTION FEE FOR CLAIMING AN IMPOUNDED ANIMAL AS
REQUIRED BY OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE SECTION 3-9.18 OR FOR
CLAIMING AN IMPOUNDED DOG AS REQUIRED BY OAKLAND

1 Basic Fee for Claiming a Dog/Animal
a. First Impounding within a Year (12 Months)

b. Second Impounding within a Year (12 Months)

c. Third or Subsequent Impounding within a Year (12 Months)

2 Daily Surcharge Per Dog/Animal
a. Dog/Animal not requiring medical care

b. Dog or cat requiring medical care

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

40.00 Dog

70.00 Dog

100.00 Dog

20.00 Dog

35.00 Dog

50.00 Dog

18.00 Dog

26.00 Dog

9.00 Dog

13.00 Dog

16.00 Dog/Renewal

30.00 Animal

60.00 Animal

90.00 Animal

10.00 Animal

20.00 Animal

100.00 Dog

120.00 Dog

150.00 Dog

50.00 Dog

60.00 Dog

75.00 Dog

15.00 Dog

25.00 Dog

7.50 Dog

12.50 Dog

30.00 Dog/Renewal

40.00 Animal

70.00 Animal

100.00 Animal

15.00 Animal

30.00 Animal

150.00%

71.43%

50.00%

150.00%

71.43%

50.00%

-16.67%

-3.85%

-16.67%

-3.85%

87.50%

33.33%

16.67%

11.11%

50.00%

50.00%

I **""'._
t il.v {'oniM'il S|ierial Session



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Effi*'titc:JnU 1,2000

POLICE SERVICES

FEE DESCRIPTION

Q. REDEMPTION FEE FOR CLAIMING AN IMPOUNDED ANIMAL AS
REQUIRED BY OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE SECTION 3-9.18 OR FOR
CLAIMING AN IMPOUNDED DOG AS REQUIRED BY OAKLAND

3 Labor Costs of Officers
a. Redemption Fee for Claiming an Impounded Animal Control Officer

b. Police Officer

S. SERVICE FEE FOR CONFINING, ISOLATING AND OBSERVING ANY
ANIMAL SHOWING SYMPTOMS OF RABIES AS REQUIRED BY OAKLAND
MUNICIPAL CODE SECTION 3-9.12

T^-PROTECTIVE CUSTODY DAILY SURCHARGE FOR KEEPING ANIMALS
NOT COVERED BY FEES Q, R OR S

!_. MAXIMUM PURCHASE FEE FOR ANY ANIMAL AS ALLOWED BY
OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE SECTION 6-04.142
1 Small

2 Medium

3 Large

U. SERVICE FEE FOR DISPOSAL OF DEAD ANIMALS AS REQUIRED BY
OAKLAND MUNICIPAL CODE SECTION 3-9.21
1 Monthly Rate for Hospitals when delivered

2 Animals Under 100 Ibs.

3—Animals 100 Ibs. to 150 Ibc.

3 Animals Above 100 Ibs.

4—Animals 150 Ibc. to 200 ibc.

4 Cats

5—Animate Ovor 200 Ibc.

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

35.00 Hour

36.00 Hour

15.00 Animal/Day

&00—Animal/Day

45.00 Hour

92.00 Hour

20.00 Animal/Day

Deleted

75.00 Month/Hospital

10.00 Animal

15.00—Animal

NEW

20.00—Animal

NEW

SOrOO—Animal

125.00 Month/Hospital

20.00 Animal

Deleted

40.00 Animal

Deleted

10.00 Cat

Deleted

28.57%

155.56%

33.33%

22.00 Animal

22.00 Animal

22.00 Animal

25.00 Animal

25.00 Animal

25.00 Animal

13.64%

13.64%

13.64%

66.67%

100.00%

"use 09
C,'itv Council S[KH'iiil Session

-luiK-S, 20(10



ATTACHMENT A

of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

iil> 1,20043

POLICE SERVICES

FEE INSCRIPTION

AF. DANGEROUS AND VICIOUS DOG PERMIT FEES AS REQUIRED BY OMC
SECTION 3-9.02
1 License for Potentially Dangerous Dog

2 License for Dangerous Dog

AG. SIGNS CONTAINING VISUAL AND VERBAL WARNING AS REQUIRED BY
OMC SECTION 6-8.150*

Ak AH. VEHICLE RELEASES
4—Administrative Fee Authorized by Vehicle Code Section 22850.5 for Storing,

and Releasing Vehicles Towod-Undor Authority-ofDivision-14,- ChapteFJ-Q-of
the Vehicle Code with-the-Excoption-of Vehicle Code Section 22654-©

12 Administrative Fee Authorized by Vehicle Code Section 22850.5 for Towing/Impounding,
and Releasing Vehicles Towed/Impounded or Held Under Authority of Division
11, Chapter 10, of the Vehicle Code with the Exception of Vehicle Code 22651©

2 Administrative Fee Authorized by Vehicle Code Section 22850.5 for Processing
and Authorizing Access to Vehicles Impounded or Stored by the Police

AU AK. SPECIAL TRAFFIC OFFENDER PROGRAM (STOP) VEHICLE RELEASE
4—Towed Vehicle Release

1_ 2 Towed/Impounded Vehicle Release

AMv-SPAY OR NEUTER DEPOSIT FEE PRIOR TO SELLING OR GIVING AWAY
ANY DOG BY THE ANIMAL SHELTER (AS ALLOWED BY CALIFORNIA
FOOD AND AGRICULTURAL CODE SECTION 305Q3)

AQ. NEUTER A MALE DOG OR CAT
1 Neuter a male cat/kitten

2 Neuter a male dog

3 Neuter a male cat/kitten for a licensed not for profit rescue group

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

75.00 Year

100.00 Year

5.00 Sign

75=00—Vehicle

125.00 Vehicle

10.00 Vehicle/
Access

100.00—Vohiclo

250.00 Vehicle

4QvQO—Oe§

40.00 Each

50.00 Each

New

125.00 Year

200.00 Year

8.00 Sign

Deleted

125.00 Vehicle

15.00 Vehicle/
Access

Deleted

250.00 Vehicle

Deleted

60.00 Each

100.00 Each

30.00 Each

66.67%

100.00%

60.00%

ctesc only

50.00%

ctesc only

50.00%

100.00%

PlUEf It*""' _
il S|K'Hal Session

Jum-.S, iOOfi



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
i:i1Vctivc:.liih I,2OOO

POLICE SERVICES

FEE DESCRIPTION

AQ. NEUTER A MALE DOG OR CAT
4 Neuter a male dog for a licensed not for profit rescue group

AR. SPAY FEMALE DOG OR CAT
1 Spay female cat/kitten

2 Spay female dog

3 Spay a female cat/kitten for a licensed not for profit rescue group

4 Spay a female dog for a licensed not for profit rescue group

AT. PENALTY FOR 2ND INSPECTION TO ENFORCE DANGEROUS DOG ORDINANCE

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

New 50.00 Each

55.00 Each

70.00 Each

New

New

25.00 Each

60.00 Each

100.00 Each

30.00 Each

50.00 Each

50.00 Each

9.09%

42.86%

100.00%

AX, AV. CRIME ANALYSIS PROGRAM
2 Crime Analysis Projects/Reports (no charge to City of Oakland and outside-agency law 22.00 Quarter

enforcement requesters) Hour

ar Crime Analysis-Statistical- Reports 22.00—Report

kr Gatts for-Service Reports 44.00—Report

AW. ANIMAL SHELTER MEDICAL PROCEDURES
9 Felv/Fivtest 15.00 Each

11 Euthanasia New

12 Amputation of limb New

13 Parasite treatment New

14 Minor procedure requiring sutures New

AX. DOG OBEDIENCE COURSE
1 Dogs adopted from City of Oakland Animal Shelter at time of adoption 125.00 Course

22.00 Quarter
Hour

Deleted

Deleted

25.00 Each

50.00 Animal

50.00 Animal

10.00 Application

50.00 Procedure

75.00 Course

desc only

66.67%

-40.00%

71
t iti C oimril S|K-»-iiil Session

Juni'S. 2



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Keliedule

, 20O(»

POLICE SERVICES

FEE DESCRIPTION

AX. DOG OBEDIENCE COURSE
2 Dogs not adopted from City of Oakland Animal Shelter or not at time of adoption

BA. PERMIT FEE FOR MULTIPLE DOGS AS REQUIRED BY OAKLAND
MUNICIPAL CODE SECTION 6-04.40Q

BB. PET SUPPLIES
1 Cat Carrier

2 Dog Collar

3 Leash

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

ctesc only150.00 Course

New

New

New

New

150.00 Course

50.00 Permit

5.00 Carrier

5.00 Collar

10.00 Leash

I**'"' —
'H S|ii'rial Session

Ji.iu-8. 2OO«



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

: Jul> 1, 2O4H5

PUBLIC WORKS;

FEE DESCRIPTION

DESIGN & CONSTRUCTION
CONTRACT ADMINISTRATION

A. CITY OF OAKLAND STANDARD DETAIL FOR PUBLIC WORKS
2 Mailing Surcharge

TRANSPORTATION SERVICES
C. RESIDENTIAL PERMIT PARKING FEE

1 Permit for Eligible Vehicles of Residents, Employees of Neighborhood-Serving
Establishments, and Owners or Employees of Business with the Vehicle
Registered at the Business Address
a. Initial

1 Purchase Between January 1 and June 30

2 Purchase Between July 1 and December 31

b. Renewal (annual)

2 Permit for Eligible Vehicles of Owners or Employees of Businesses with the
Vehicle Not Registered at the Business Address
a. Initial

1 Purchase Between January 1 and June 30

2 Purchase Between July 1 and December 31

b. Renewal (annual)

3 Replacement of Lost or Damaged Permit

4 Visitor Permit
a. One-day

b. 14-day

H. TRAFFIC ENGINEERING ANALYSIS
3 Credit Card Processing Fee

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

4.00 Mailing

17.50 Vehicle

25.00 Vehicle

15.00 Vehicle

4.05 Mailing

35.00 Vehicle

65.00 Vehicle

65.00 Vehicle

1.25%

100.00%

160.00%

333.33%

37.50

75.00

75.00

10.00

1.00

5.00

Vehicle

Vehicle

Vehicle

Vehicle

Permit

Permit

60.00

120.00

120.00

20.00

2.00

10.00

Vehicle

Vehicle

Vehicle

Vehicle

Permit

Permit

60.00%

60.00%

60.00%

100.00%

100.00%

100.00%

New 3% Transaction

O'itv Coiim-H S|K'<-i:il S
.him- S. 20OK



ATTACHMENT A

of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Eflccthc:Jnb I.2OO6

PUBLIC WORKS

FEE DESCRIPTION

FACILITIES & ENVIRONMENT
KEEP OAKLAND CLEAN & BEAUTIFUL

C. INVESTIGATION, REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL OF ILLEGAL DUMPING
4 Sidewalk Encroachment Fee

5 Abuse of Litter Container Fee

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

New

New

500.00 Incident

500.00 Incident

INFRASTRUCTURE & OPERATIONS
ELECTRICAL & ENERGY EFFICIENCY

B. UNDERGROUND REVOLVING FUND ADMINISTRATION RULE 20A & RULE 20B UNDERGROUNDING ENGINEERING SERVICE FEES

1 Electrical Engineer III

2 Underground Coordinator

3 CAD Designer

4 Council Resolution & Report (Actual costs billed above deposit amount)

C. CROSS STREET BANNER INSTALLATION/REMOVAL

1 International Boulevard

2 Laurel Archway (East End)

3 Laurel Archway (West End)

D. REPAIRS FOR DAMAGE TO CITY OF OAKLAND STREETLIGHT & TRAFFIC

SIGNAL EQUIPMENT

j_ Labor

2 Materials

New

New

New

New

New

New

New

New

New

153.00 Hour

108.00 Hour

50.00 Hour

15.000.00 Deposit

625.00 Event

425.00 Event

425.00 Event

Actual Cost

Actual Cost

Item _
C.'ltv Council S|K-cial Session

S. 2000



ATTACHMENT A

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule

1,2000

PUBLIC WORKS

FEE DESCRIPTION
E. RELOCATION OR INSTALLATION OF TRAFFIC SIGNALS OR STREET LIGHTS

1 Labor

a. Electrical Engineer III

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT % CHANGE

b. ElectricalJjuaervjsor

c. Electrical Line Crew

d. Electrician

Materials

3 PG&E Service Connection

F. ELECTRICAL ENGINEERING REVIEW

SEWERS & STORM DRAIN MAINTENANCE
A. BOARDING OF WINDOWS AND DOORS

Personnel Services Fee Schedule
a. Normal Operating Hours - 8:00 am to 4^00 pm midnight. Monday Through Friday

New

New

New

New

New

New

New

300.00 2 Hours

153.00 Hour

124.00 Hour

270.00 Hour

100.00 Hour

Estimated Cost

Actual cost

153.00 Hour

300.00 2 Hours desc only

C'ity 1'oiiin'jl SjK-ciul



ATTACHMENT B

City of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Approved b> City Council in FY O.VtMf

COMMUNITY AND

ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

MISCELLANEOUS
RESIDENTIAL, RENT ADJUSTMENT

B. RENT PROGRAM SERVICE FEE

1 Annual Service Fee per Unit (Fees are due January 1 and delinquent March 1)

2 If paid within 30 days late, add 10% late fee. In addition add simple interest of
1%of the balance owed (Fee + late charges) per month or fraction of a month

3 If paid within 60 days late, add 25%.

4 If paid after 60 days late, add 50%.

WORKFORCE DEVELOPMENT
A. PROCESS FEE

1 Enterprise Zone Hiring Tax Credit Vouchers Processing Fee

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT ORD #

26.00 Unit

26.00 + 10% Unit

26.00 + 25% Unit

26.00 + 50% Unit

44.00 Each

24.00 Unit

24.00 + 10% Unit

24.00 + 25% Unit

24.00 + 50% Unit

50.00 Each

12716

12716

12716

12716

12716

Page I
Cif.v Council Special Session

, 2OO«



ATTACHMENT B

Cit> of Oakland
Master Fee Schedule
Approved by City Council iit FY O.VOtt

FINANCE &

MANAGEMENT

FEE DESCRIPTION

INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY MANAGEMENT
A. RADIO

OLD FEE / UNIT NEW FEE / UNIT HESO

List Price Each
in

Ericsson-
GE

Communic
ation

Equipment

List Price in Each
M/A-Com.

Communicatt
on

Equipment

79665

Page 2 Item _
City CwHH-ii S|MK'itiI Svssimi

.hint- s, a



APPROVED AS TOFORM AND LEGALITY

INTRODUCED BrY-£QUNlCILMEMBER _
' }FHCE r- A--;-,',;.,' ' - - r - h r '

2 0 B S J U J - ! P H & I S OAKLAND CITY COUNCIL
ORDINANCE No. C.M.S.

City Attorney

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE NUMBER 12676 C.M.S. (MASTER
FEE SCHEDULE), AS AMENDED, TO ESTABLISH, MODIFY AND DELETE
FEES ASSESSED BY THE OFFICE OF THE CITY COUNCIL, OFFICE OF THE
CITY ADMINISTRATOR, OFFICE OF THE CITY ATTORNEY, OFFICE OF
THE CITY CLERK, COMMUNITY AND ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT
AGENCY, FINANCE AND MANAGEMENT AGENCY, FIRE SERVICES
AGENCY, OFFICE OF PARKS AND RECREATION, POLICE SERVICES
AGENCY, AND PUBLIC WORKS AGENCY.

WHEREAS, the City of Oakland periodically updates its Master Fee Schedule to account for
general cost of living increases and program changes or other costs; and

WHEREAS, the fee modifications and additions proposed herein have been justified by the
respective agencies and are identified in an "Agenda Report" dated June 8, 2006 to Deborah
Edgerly, City Administrator, entitled "An Ordinance Amending Ordinance Number 12676 C.M.S.
(Master Fee Schedule), as Amended, to Establish, Modify, and Delete Fees Assessed by selected
Offices, Departments, and Agencies of the City of Oakland"; and

WHEREAS, the City Council finds and determines that the herein-referenced modifications and
additions are necessary to reimburse the City for the costs of performing the various municipal and
regulatory functions; and

WHEREAS, a Public Hearing was held on June 8, 2006, to review the proposed fee changes; now,
therefore

THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF OAKLAND DOES ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. The Master Fee Schedule as set forth in Ordinance Number 12676 C.M.S., as amended,
is hereby amended to modify and establish fees assessed by the Office of the City Council, Office of
the City Administrator, Office of the City Attorney, Office of the City Clerk, Community and
Economic Redevelopment Agency, Finance and Management Agency, Fire Services Agency, Office
of Parks and Recreation, Police Services Agency, and Public Works Agency and as set forth in
Exhibit A, attached hereto and made a part hereof.



Ordinance Amending the Master Fee Schedule Page 2

Section 2. This ordinance shall be effective on July 1, 2006 upon approval by the Council of the
City of Oakland.

IN COUNCIL, OAKLAND, CALIFORNIA , 20

PASSED BY THE FOLLOWING VOTE:

AYES- BROOKS, BRUNNER, CHANG, KERNIGHAN, NADEL, QUAN, REID, and PRESIDENT DE LA FUENTE

NOES-

ABSENT-

ABSTENTION-

ATTEST;
LaTonda Simmons

City Clerk and Clerk of the Council
Council of the City of Oakland, California



ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE NUMBER 12676 CM.S. (MASTER
FEE SCHEDULE), AS AMENDED, TO ESTABLISH, MODIFY AND DELETE
FEES ASSESSED BY THE OFFICE OF THE CITY COUNCIL, OFFICE OF
THE CITY ADMINISTRATOR, OFFICE OF THE CITY ATTORNEY, OFFICE
OF THE CITY CLERK, COMMUNITY AND ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT
AGENCY, FINANCE AND MANAGEMENT AGENCY, FIRE SERVICES
AGENCY, OFFICE OF PARKS AND RECREATION, POLICE SERVICES
AGENCY, AND PUBLIC WORKS AGENCY.

NOTICE AND DIGEST

This Ordinance authorizes an amendment to Ordinance Number 12676 C.M.S. (Master
Fee Schedule), as amended, to establish, modify and delete fees assessed by the Office of
the City Council, Office of the City Administrator, Office of the City Attorney, Office of
the City Clerk, Community and Economic Development Agency, Finance and
Management Agency, Fire Services Agency, Office of Parks and Recreation, Police
Services Agency, and Public Works Agency. These amended fees would become
effective July 1, 2006 and would remain in effect until further notice. A public hearing
has been scheduled to review the proposed fee changes. The meeting will take place at
the time of the first reading of the proposed ordinance by the Council, at 5:00 pm on
June 8, 2006.



NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

A Public Hearing has been scheduled to review changes to various fees charged by the following
City of Oakland departments and agencies: Office of the City Council, Office of the City
Administrator, Office of the City Attorney, Office of the City Clerk, Community and Economic
Development Agency, Finance and Management Agency, Fire Services Agency, Office of Parks
and Recreation, Police Services Agency, and Public Works Agency. These amended fees would
become effective July 1, 2006 and would remain in effect until further notice. The Public
Hearing will take place during the first reading of the Agenda item at 5:00 pm on Thursday,
June 8, 2006, in the City Council Chambers (City Hall, One Frank Ogawa Plaza, Third Floor,
Oakland, CA 94612).


